
Administrative Procedures ~..~ 

Final Proposed Filing - Coversheet FINAL PROPOSED RULE # ~ ~ ~~ 

~r~~l ~c~~~e~ i ir~~ - ~vrsh~e 
Instructions 

In accordance with Title 3 Chapter 25 of the Vermont Statutes Annotated and the 
"Rule on Rulemaking" adopted by the Office of the Secretary of State, this filing will 

be considered complete upon filing and acceptance of these forms with the Office of 

the Secretary of State, and the Legislative Committee on Administrative Rules. 

All forms shall be submitted at the Office of the Secretary of State, no later than 3:30 
pm on the last scheduled day of the work week. 

The data provided in text areas of these forms will be used to generate a notice of 

rulemaking in the portal of "Proposed Rule Postings" online, and the newspapers of 

record if the rule is marked for publication. Publication of notices will be charged 

back to the promulgating agency. 
,. .. .- . ,.-~.r ~,,. ~.,ic ?~,,,.,•...rr rxriririr~tir,rxt~f.nrr~~w.xss.:vrrrrrrrie~iv~~~:rrrrec~:r r~•ir rx,'rr;,r 

PLEASE REMOVE ANY COVERSHEET OR FORM NOT 

REQUIRED WITH THE CURRENT FILING BEFORE DELIVERY! 
. . ,_.•.r~.c~.NI. ~u sor.Y~.r...rvYS:r~ir~.r/sfX.'.wrax~+xaN.Y/-xAr r.:r: ~irr.w~.rrs~rr rxw~X/reve~i;+#r..~. ; , /.~'/.f:r a~mlu_+Grr//rr 

Certification Statement: As the adopting Authority of this rule (see 3 V.S.A. § 801 

(b) (11) for a definition), I approve the contents of this filing entitled: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

/s/ Gerald Garrow 

(signature) 

on' 

(da e) 

Printed Name and Title: 
Gerald Garrow, Chair, Plumbers Examining Board/Chief 

Plumbing Inspector/Regional Manager 

RECEIVED BY: 

Coversheet 

Adopting Page 

Economic Impact Analysis 

Environmental Impact Analysis 

Strategy for Maximizing Public Input 

Scientific Information Statement (if applicable) 

Incorporated by Reference Statement (if applicable) 

Clean text of the rule (Amended text without annotation) 

Annotated text (Clearly marking changes from previous rule) 

ICAR Minutes 

Copy of Comments 

Responsiveness Summary 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Administrative Procedures 

Final Proposed Filing — Coversheet 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. PROPOSED NUMBER ASSIGNED BY THE SECRETARY OF STATE 

P 

3. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

4. PRIMARY CONTACT PERSON: 

~A PERSON WHO ISABLE TO ANSWER QUESTIONSABOUT THE CONTENT OF THE RULE. 

Name: Gerald Garrow, Chair, Vermont Plumbers Examining 

Board 

Agency: Department of Public Safety 

Mailing Address: 56 Howe Street, Bldg A, Suite 

200, Rutland, VT 05701-3449 

Telephone: (802) 786-5841 Fax: (802) 786-5872 

E-Mail: gerald. garrow@vermont . gov 

Web URL (WHERE THE R ULE WILL BE POSTED 

www.firesafety.vermont.gov 

5. SECONDARY CONTACT PERSON: 

~A SPECIFIC PERSON FROM WHOM COPIES OF FILINGS MAY BE REQUESTED OR WHO MAY 

ANSWER QUESTIONSABOUT FORMS SUBMITTED FOR FILING IF DIFFERENT FROMTHE 

PRIMARY CONTACT PERSON. 

Name: Robert T Sponable, Deputy Director 

Agency: Department of Public Safety - Division of Fire 

Safety 

Mailing Address: 45 State Drive, Waterbury, VT 05671 

Telephone: (802) 479-7566 Fax: (802) 479-7562 

E-Mail: robert . sponable@vermont . gov 

6. RECORDS EXEMPTION INCLUDED WITHIN RULE:

DOES THE RULE CONTAINANYPROVISIONDESIGNATING INFORMATIONAS CONFIDENTIAL; 

LIMITING ITS P UBLIC RELEASE; OR OTHERWISE, EXEMPTING IT FROMINSPECTIONAND 

COPYING?~ No 

IF YES, CITE THE STATUTORY AUTHORITY FOR THE EXEMPTION: 

PLEASE SUMMARIZE THE REASON FOR THE EXEMPTION: 

7. LEGAL AUTHORITY / ENABLING LEGISLATION: 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 2 



Administrative Procedures 

Final Proposed Filing — Coversheet 

(THE SPECIFIC STAT UTORY OR LEGAL CITATION FROM SESSION LAW INDICATING WHO THE 

ADOPTING ENTITY IS AND THUS WHO THE SIGNATORY SHO ULD BE. THIS SHO ULD BE A 

SPECIFIC CITATIONNOTA CHAPTER CITATION). 

26 V.S.A. 2173 

8. EXPLANATION OF HOW THE RULE IS WITHIN THE AUTHORITY OF 

THE AGENCY: 
The Plumbers Examination Board may, pursuant to 3 

V.S.A. Chapter 25 (Administrative Procedure Act), make 

and revise such plumbing rules as necessary for the 

protection of public health. 

9. THE FILING HAS CHANGED SINCE THE FILING OF THE PROPOSED 

RULE. 

10. THE AGENCY HAS INCLUDED WITH THIS FILING A LETTER 

EXPLAINING IN DETAIL WHAT CHANGES WERE MADE, CITING CHAPTER 

AND SECTION WHERE APPLICABLE. 

11. SUBSTANTIAL ARGUMENTS AND CONSIDERATIONS WERE NOT 

RAISED FOR OR AGAINST THE ORIGINAL PROPOSAL. 

12. THE AGENCY HAS NOT INCLUDED COPIES OF ALL WRITTEN 

SUBMISSIONS AND SYNOPSES OF ORAL COMMENTS RECEIVED. 

13. THE AGENCY HAS NOT INCLUDED A LETTER EXPLAINING IN 

DETAIL THE REASONS FOR THE AGENCY' S DECISION TO REJECT OR 

ADOPT THEM. 

14. CONCISE SUMMARY (150 woRns oR LEss): 

The primary intent and focus of this rule is to update 

the Vermont adoption of the International Plumbing Code 

from the 2018 edition to the 2021 edition. The rules 

also allow for the updating of current methods and 

materials to be utilized. These rules are amended to 

clarify intent and answer frequently asked questions. 

15. EXPLANATION OF WHY THE RULE IS NECESSARY: 

The periodic updating and review of the International 

Plumbing Code is necessary to provide consistancy with 

other State regulations and national codes and to 

identify and address new technologies. These rules are 

necessary to assist in maintaining a safe and healthy 

environment which may be threatened by potential unsafe 

plumbing practices 

16. EXPLANATION OF HOW THE RULE IS NOT ARBITRARY: 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 3 



Administrative Procedures 

Final Proposed Filing — Coversheet 

This rule does not single out any one entity. This rule 

applies a fair and unbiased application of the 

International Plumbing Code to all entities in the 

State of Vermont that are subject to the application of 

the Plumbing Code. The International Plumbing Code is 

widely utilized and recognized throughout the United 

States. 

17. LIST OF PEOPLE, ENTERPRISES AND GOVERNMENT ENTITIES 

AFFECTED BY THIS RULE: 

Licensed plumbers, consulting engineers, the City of 

Burlington and other local Cities and towns, the 

Department of Health, the Agency of Natural Resources, 

the Department of Buildings and General Services, 

Vermont Fuel Dealers Association, Vermont Home Builders 

and Remodelers Association, Office of the Attorney 

General, Plumbers & PipefittersLocal 693, International 

Code Council (ICC), Building Safety Association of 

Vermont, Agency of Commerce and Community Development, 

Department of Labor (State Apprenticeship Council), 

Vermont Technical College (Technology Extension 

Division) American Institute of Architects, American 

Society of Heating, Refrigeration & Air Conditioning 

Engineers, American Council of Engineering Consultants, 

Division of Historic Preservation, Vermont Bar 

Association, Vermont Bankers Association, Association 

of Vermont Credit Unions, Vermont Association of 

Realtors, home owners and commercial building owners. 

18. BRIEF SUMMARY OF ECONOMIC IMPACT (150 worms ox LEss): 

There will be no adverse effect from the current rules. 

Updating the Plumbing Code may provide some cost saving 

alternatives, not currently available in the currently 

adopted Code version. 

19. A HEARING WAS HELD. 

20. HEARING INFORMATION 

(THE FIRST HEARING SHALL BE NO SOONER THAN 30 DAYS FOLLOWING THE POSTING OF 

NOTICES ONLINE. 

IF THIS FORM IS INSUFFICIENT TO LIST THE INFORMATION FOR EACH HEARING, PLEASE 

ATTACH A SEPARATE SHEET TO COMPLETE THE HEARING INFORMATION. 

Date: 

Time: AM 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 4 



Administrative Procedures 
Final Proposed Filing — Coversheet 

Street Address: 

Zip Code: 

Date: 

Time: AM 

Street Address: 

Zip Code: 

Date: 

Time: AM 

Street Address: 

Zip Code: 

Date: 

Time: AM 

Street Address: 

Zip Code: 

21. DEADLINE FOR COMMENT ~NO EARLIER THAN 7 DAYS FOLLOWING LAST HEARING: 

KEYWORDS (PLEASE PROVIDE AT LEAST 3 KEYWORDS OR PHRASES TO AID IN THE 

SEARCHABILITY OF THE RULE NOTICE ONLINE. 

Plumbing 

License 

Inspection 

Heating System 

Water Treatment 

Revised November 1, 2021 page S 



Department of Public Safety 
Division of Fire Safety 
Central Administrative Office 

45 State Drive 
Waterbury, VT o56~i 
Firesafety.vermont.gov 

September 23rd, 2022 

To: James Condos, Secretary of State 

Mark McDonald, Senator — LCAR Chair 

RE: 2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

(phone) (802)479-7561
(fax) (802) 479-7562

This letter is to advise of changes made to the original submittal, after our public hearing. 

In Section 8, page 9, language has been added to include the VT Energy Goals requirement and to 
better clarify the intent and purpose of the rule. These changes encompass information that was 
gathered during the public input portion of the rule's adoption process. 

(C) Universal Licensing: 

(C the applicant completes a VT Ener~v Goals Education Module & includes the certificate with 
the application. The website to access the module is: VT Energy Goals • Custom Portal 
(powerappsportals.uw 

Reason for change. Omitted from the original submittal 

Cost associated with the change. This change will see no significant cost per licensee. 

In Section 21, page 20, the website,for VT Energy StandaNds has been updated. 

We also made numerous updates, throughout the rules document, to reflect address changes of our 
Central and Waterbury (old Barre) Offices. 

For the Division of Fire Safety, 

GJ Garrow, RM, Chief Plumbing Inspector/Chair of the Vermont Plumbing Examining Board 

Robert Sponable, Deputy Director — Division of Fire Safety 

Regional Offices — Waterbury/Rutland/Springfield/Williston Vermont Fire Academy - Pittsford 

~~ C: € 
.t..~" 



Administrative Procedures 

Adopting Page 

~1~!•! ' ` i ~` s ~! 

Instructions• 

This form must accompany each filing made during the rulemaking process: 

Note: To satisfy the requirement for an annotated text, an agency must submit the entire 

rule in annotated form with proposed and final proposed filings. Filing an annotated 

paragraph or page of a larger rule is not sufficient. Annotation must clearly show the 

changes to the rule. 

When possible, the agency shall file the annotated text, using the appropriate page or 

pages from the Code of Vermont Rules as a basis for the annotated version. New rules 

need not be accompanied by an annotated text. 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 
2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3. TYPE OF FILINGPLEASE CHOOSE THE TYPE OF FILING FROMTHE DROPDOWNMENU 

BASED ON THE DEFINITIONS PROVIDED BELOW : 

• AMENDMENT - Any change to an already existing rule, 

even if it is a complete rewrite of the rule, it is considered 

an amendment if the rule is replaced with other text. 

• NEW RULE - A rule that did not previously exist even under 

a different name. 

• REPEAL - The removal of a rule in its entirety, without 

replacing it with other text. 

This filing is AN AMENDMENT OF AN EXISTING RULE 

4. LAST ADOPTEDPLEASE PROVIDE THE SOS LOG#, TITLE AND EFFECTIVE DATE OF 

THE LAST ADOPTION FOR THE EXISTING R ULE~ 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



State of Vermont [phone] 8oz-sz8-3gzz Kristin L. Clouser, Secretary 
Agency of Administration [fax 8o2-8a8-z4z8 
io9 State Street 
Montpelier, VTo56o9-o2oi 
www.aoa.vermont.gov 

INTERAGENCY COMMITTEE ON ADMINISTRATIVE RULES (ICAR) MINUTES 

Meeting Date/Location: June 13, 2022, virtually via Microsoft Teams 
Members Present: Chair Douglas Farnham, Brendan Atwood. Jared Adler, Jennifer Mojo, Diane 

Sherman, Mike Obuchowski and Donnci Ruse-Savage 
Members Absent: John Kessler and Diane Bothfeld 
Minutes By: MelissaMazza-Paquette 

• 2:01 p.m. meeting called to order, welcome and i ntroductions. 
• Committee discussion on process improvements i ~ scheduled for the Au<~ ust meeting to allow for 

participation from all members. 
• Review and approval of minutes from the May 9. ~ i ~ ~ ? meetin ~~ . 
• No additions/deletionsto agenda. Agenda appro~ ~~I .l~ ~lr ~ft~d. 
• Note: An emergency rule titled ̀ Vita I IZecor~l~ Lm ~ r~ ~ ~ n~ r Rai I~', provided by the Agency of Human 

Services, Department of Health, was s~ippr~rt~ci b~ IC~.~C~ ~~harr Farnham on May 16, 2022. This rulemaking 
implements a process for individualsto an~en~J the marl~cr ~~n their birth certificateto reflectthe individual's 
gender identity. Specificall~~. it does the fol lu~~ i gig: I ) Ucirocs the tcrn~ "non-binary" to describe the 
additional gender identities that u~av be reflzcte~l ~~n a birth pert i ~ ic~itc. ?) Creates a process for registrants 
to file their Affidavituf G~n~I~r I~lcntitvv~ ith rho Dep~~rtm~nt. 

• One public commentn~ade h~ ~"cnn ~Sain~ ~\ i l~l~r~ . 
• PT'OSerit1t1OriOfPPOpOSOa IZLI ~C~ ~~n ~)~1~,C~ '- I U lC~ I~O~ ~O~~V. 

1. 2021 Verm~~nt P~umhin~ Rule. D~}~~lrtment ~~I~Puh~ic Safety & Plumbers ExaminingBoard, page 2 
2. Vital Rec<~r~~ iZulc. .~~~~n~~ ~~F f luman ~cr~ice~_ Department of Health, page 3 
3. Rule =}.6(~i~ llefinitiut~ oI~ I ~I~~t~~iclr~~nsmissiun I~acilityin30 V.S.A. § 248, Public Utility Commission, 

page ~ 
4. Health 13cn~tits Eligibility ~~nd L~~rullment Rule, General Provisions and Definitions (Part 1), Agency of 

Human Ser~~icc~, page 5 
5. Health Benefit ~ l l i ̀ ~ibility a n ~1 enrollment Rule, Eligibility Standards (Part 2), Agency of Human 

Services, page 6 
6. Health Benefits Eli~~i b i I i t ~ and I~nrollment Rule, Nonfinancial Eligibility Requirements (Part 3), 

Agency of Human Seri i~e~. page 7 
7. Health Benefits Eligibility and Enrollment Rule, Financial Methodologies (Part 5), Agency of Human 

Services, page 8 
8. Health Benefits Eligibility and Enrollment Rule, Eligibility-and-Enrollment Procedures (Part 7), 

Agency of Human Services, page 9 
9. Administrative Rules of the Board of Nursing, Secretary of State, Office of Professional Regulation, 

page 10 
• Next scheduled meeting is Monday, July 11, 2022 at 2:00 p.m. 
• 3:25 p.m. meeting was paused fora 15-minute break 
• Add discussion ofstrike-all rules for transparency at a future meeting as time allows. 
• 3:50 p.m. meeting adjourned. 

~~~~~~ ~, 

06-13-22 ICAR Minutes, Page 1 of 10 



Proposed Rule: 2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules, Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining 

Board 

Presented By: G.J. Garrow and Bob Sponable 

Motion made to accept the rule by Brendan Atwood, seconded by Mike Obuchowski, and passed 

unanimously with the following recommendations: 

1. Proposed Rule Coversheet, #8: Include detail about what the changes are and/or if appropriate state 

that the changes are minor. Could include language from the Economic Impact Analysis. 

2. Public Input Maximization Plan, #3: Clarify who will receivethe mailing as "home owners and 

commercial building owners" are included in #4. 

3. Annotated rule text, Section 3 (12): Include language at the h~ dinning of the definition such as 

"'Shall mean' to keep existing..." 

06-13-22ICAR Minutes, Page 2 of 10 



Administrative Procedures 

Economic Impact Analysis 

Instructions• 

In completing the economic impact analysis, an agency analyzes and evaluates the 

anticipated costs and benefits to be expected from adoption of the rule; estimates the 

costs and benefits for each category of people enterprises and government entities 

affected by the rule; compares alternatives to adopting the rule; and explains their 

analysis concluding that rulemaking is the most appropriate method of achieving the 

regulatory purpose. If no impacts are anticipated, please specify "No impact 

anticipated" in the field. 

Rules affecting or regulating schools or school districts must include cost implications 

to local school districts and taxpayers in the impact statement, a clear statement of 

associated costs, and consideration of alternatives to the rule to reduce or ameliorate 

costs to local school districts while still achieving the objectives of the rule (see 3 

V.S.A. § 832b for details). 

Rules affecting small businesses (excluding impacts incidental to the purchase and 

payment of goods and services by the State or an agency thereof , must include ways 

that a business can reduce the cost or burden of compliance or an explanation of why 

the agency determines that such evaluation isn't appropriate, and an evaluation of 

creative, innovative or flexible methods of compliance that would not significantly 

impair the effectiveness of the rule or increase the risk to the health, safety, or welfare 

of the public or those affected by the rule. 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3. CATEGORY OF AFFECTED PARTIES: 

LIST CATEGORIES OF PEOPLE, ENTERPRISES, AND GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES POTENTIALLY 

AFFECTED BYTHE ADOPTION OF THIS RULE AND THE ESTIMATED COSTS AND BENEFITS 

ANTICIPATED: 

Licensed plumbers, consulting engineers, the City of 

Burlington, the Department of Health, the Agency of 

Natural Resources, the Department of Buildings & 

General Services, Vermont Fuel Dealers Association, 

Vermont Homebuilders & Remodelers Association, Office 

of the Attorney General, Plumbers & Pipefitters Local 

693, International Code Council (ICC), Building Safety 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Administrative Procedures 

Economic Impact Analysis 

Association of Vermont, Agency of Commerce & Community 

Development, Department of Labor (State Apprenticeship 

Council), Vermont Technical College (Technology 

Extension Division), American Institue of Architects, 

Ammerican Society of Heating, Refrigerating & Air 

Conditioning Engineers, American Council of Engineering 

Consultants, Division of Historic Preservation, Vermont 

Bar Association, Vermont Bankers Association, 

Association of Vermont Credit Unions, Vermont 

Association of Realtors, home owners and commercial 

building owners. 

These rules afford plumbers the use of the most current 

plumbing code available. It allows the most current 

changes in technologies for materials and design 

practices. The plumbing code changes are minor and no 

increase in cost is anticipated. 

Some of the rules sections have been changed/updated 

for the clarification of the intent of the rule. 

4. IMPACT ON SCHOOLS: 

INDICATEANYIMPACT TRATTHE RULE WILL HAVE ONPUBLIC EDUCATION, PUBLIC 

SCHOOLS, LOCAL SCHOOL DISTRICTS AND/OR T~4XPAYERS CLEARLY STATING ANY 

ASSOCIATED COSTS.' 

The one minor impact will be the 2018 stautorily 

mandated signage change for single user bathrooms for 

the newly defined gender free restrooms that the 

Vermont Plumbers Examiners Board was charge with 

enforcing. This involves signage changes for single 

user mens and ladies room to read "RESTROOM". The 

Plumbers Examining Board has no control over the cost 

of the signs or labor involved 

Otherwise the plumbing work in school buildings will be 

impacted the same as other commercial buildings, no 

change from previous rule. 

S. ALTERNATIVES: CONSIDERATION OFALTERNATIVES TO THE RULE TO REDUCE OR 

AMELIORATE COSTS TO LOCAL SCHOOL DISTRICTS WHILE STILL ACHIEVING THE OBJECTIVE 

OF THE RULE. 

Schools looking for consideration of alternatives to 

the rule currently have the option of the variance 

process outlined in the rules. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 2 



Administrative Procedures 

Economic Impact Analysis 

6. IMPACT ON SMALL BUSINESSES: 

INDICATE ANYIMPACT THAT THE RULE WILL HAVE ON SMALL BUSINESSES ~EXCL UDING 

IMPACTS INCIDENTAL TO THE PURCHASE AND PAYMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES BY THE 

STATE OR ANAGENCYTHEREOF 

Impact to small businesses should not be significant, 

as compared to the requirements of the currently 

adopted rule. Most generally, small businesses would 

see this minimal impact during a new construction or 

renovation project. 

7. SMALL BUSINESS COMPLIANCE: EXPLAIN WAYSA BUSINESS CANREDUCE THE 

COST/BURDEN OF COMPLIANCE OR AN EXPLANATION OF WHY THE AGENCYDETERMINES 

THAT SUCH EVAL UATION ISN'T APPROPRIATE. 

Plumbing codes need to be applied equally throughout 

the state to ensure the public health and safety. 

Buildings on public water and wastewater systems are 

interconnected, so that risks in an exempt building 

could be passed on to another building. A separate 

standard for small business would be inconsistent with 

3 V.S.A. 832a. 

8. COMPARISON: 

COMPARE THE IMPACT OF THE R ULE WITH THE ECONOMIC IMPACT OF OTHER 

ALTERNATIVES TO THE R ULE, INCLUDING NO R ULE ON THE SUBJECT OR A R ULE HAVING 

SEPARATE REQ UIREMENTS FOR SMALL B USINESS: 

The International Plumbing Code takes into 

consideration small business by having fewer 

requirements, or exceptions, for the number and type of 

plumbing fixtures required. 

9. SUFFICIENCY: DESCRIBE HOW THEANALYSIS WAS CONDUCTED, IDENTIFYING 

RELEVANT INTERNAL AND/OR EXTERNAL SOURCES OF INFORMATION USED. 

In evaluating the changes in the 2021 International 

Plumbing Code the current 2018 edition, there were no 

signifiacnt changes that would create an increase in 

costs to small business or schools. The general cost of 

plumbing projects/installations/modifications will be 

based on labor costsand component and material costs. 

Labor costs should remain consistent with current and 

regional trends and component and material costs may 

vary based on availibility, shipping costs and delays 

created by supply chain issues. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 3 



Administrative Procedures 

Environmental Impact Analysis 

Instructions: 

In completing the environmental impact analysis, an agency analyzes and evaluates 
the anticipated environmental impacts (positive or negative) to be expected from 
adoption of the rule; compares alternatives to adopting the rule; explains the 

sufficiency of the environmental impact analysis. If no impacts are anticipated, please 
specify "No impact anticipated" in the field. 

Examples of Environmental Impacts include but are not limited to: 

• Impacts on the emission of greenhouse gases 

• Impacts on the discharge of pollutants to water 

• Impacts on the arability of land 

• Impacts on the climate 

• Impacts on the flow of water 

• Impacts on recreation 

• Or other environmental impacts 

~:<-v:~~., ~€.r-~:~:~rri.r,~..~i~~,.~ i .s~>n~~~ r-.ra-~rrr..rre , i.~ :~,~;~:~s~~.~i..,,~r~ r...r.,a~.~ ~::,~::~ ~.~ rrr ~,.a i~:.v..~~..~,~ ~r.~.~ µ r ~r .~~~n. ~i~ ~~ rir ,.ter r~e ~*s, rr..~t .rir..~,..:r .v,r ~~s,. ~~c, iv=F~ 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3 . GREENHOUSE GAS : EXPLAIN HOW THE RULE IMPACTS THE EMISSION OF 

GREENHOUSE GASES ~E. G. TRANSPORTATION OF PEOPLE OR GOODS; BUILDING 

INFRASTRUCTURE; LAND LISE AND DEVELOPMENT, WASTE GENERATION, ETC. 

These rules will not increase or decrease the impact on 

transportation, building infrastructure, land use and 

development or waste generation. These rules are 

designed for buildings and the proper installation of 

interior water piping, waste piping and venting. 

4. WATER: EXPLAIN HOW THE R ULE IMPACTS WATER ~E. G. DISCHARGE /ELIMINATION OF 

POLL UTION INTO VERMONT WATERS, THE FLOW OF WATER IN THE STATE, WATER QUALITY 

ETC. : 

These rules apply to plumbing work in buildings. Water 

supplies and wastewater treatment are not regulated 

under these rules. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Administrative Procedures 

Environmental Impact Analysis 

S . LAND : EXPLAIN HOW THE R ULE IMPACTS LAND ~E. G. IMPACTS ON FORESTRY, 

AGRICULTURE ETC. : 

These rules apply to plumbing work in buildings and 

would have no impact on this category. 

6. RECREATION: EXPLAIN HOW THE RULE IMPACT RECREATION IN THE STATE.' 

These rules would have no negative impact on the 

quality of recreation in Vermont. 

7. CLIMATE: EXPLAIN HOW THE R ULE IMPACTS THE CLIMATE IN THE STATE: 

There will be no positive or negative impact to the 

climate 

S. OTHER: EXPLAINHOW THE RULE IMPACT OTHER ASPECTS OF VERMONT'S 

ENVIRONMENT.' 

These rules are for buildings. The rule does not have 

authority for regulating impacts on other aspects of 

Vermont's environment 

9. SUFFICIENCY: DESCRIBE HOW THE ANALYSIS WAS CONDUCTED, IDENTIFYING 

RELEVANT INTERNAL AND/OR EXTERNAL SOURCES OF INFORMATION USED. 

This is an update of an existing rule and there are no 

aspects of the changes that warrant an environmental 

impact analysis. The vast majority of changes are in 

language only for clarification and others are due to 

language changes in the international plumbing code and 

2018 statutorily mandated requirements that the 

Plumbers Examining Board had no control over. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 2 



Administrative Procedures 

Public Input Maximization Plan 

~ • ~ ~ w~ ' i ~ r' 

Instructions• 

Agencies are encouraged to hold hearings as part of their strategy to maximize the 

involvement of the public in the development of rules. Please complete the form 

below by describing the agency's strategy for maximizing public input (what it did do, 

or will do to maximize the involvement of the public). 

This form must accompany each filing made during the rulemaking process: 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3. PLEASE DESCRIBE THE AGENCY' S STRATEGY TO MAXIMIZE PUBLIC 

INVOLVEMENT IN THE DEVELOPMENT OF THE PROPOSED RULE, 

LISTING THE STEPS THAT HAVE BEEN OR WILL BE TAKEN TO COMPLY 

WITH THAT STRATEGY: 

During the drafting of these proposed rules, the 

Plumbers Examining Board heard comments from affected 

parties. The proposed rules will be posted on the 

Department web page for public review. In addition to 

a public hearing, links for the proposed rules will be 

mailed directly to the organizations included under 

Section 4 of this form. 

4. BEYOND GENERAL ADVERTISEMENTS, PLEASE LIST THE PEOPLE AND 

ORGANIZATIONS THAT HAVE BEEN OR WILL BE INVOLVED IN THE 

DEVELOPMENT OF THE PROPOSED RULE: 

Licensed plumbers, consulting engineers, the City of 

Burlington, the Department of Health, the Agency of 

Natural Resources, the Department of Buildings & 

General Services, Vermont Fuel Dealers Association, 

Vermont Homebuilders & Remodelers Association, Office 

of the Attorney General, Plumbers & Pipefitters Local 

693, International Code Council (ICC), Building Safety 

Association of vermont, Agency of Commerce & Community 

Development, Department of Labor (State Apprenticeship 

Council), Vermont Technical College (Technology 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Public Input 

Extension Division), American Institue of Architects, 

Ammerican Society of Heating, Refrigerating & Air 

Conditioning Engineers, American Council of Engineering 

Consultants, Division of Historic Preservation, Vermont 

Bar Association, Vermont Bankers Association, 

Association of Vermont Credit Unions, and Vermont 

Association of Realtors. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 2 



Administrative Procedures 

Scientific Information Statement 

THIS FORM IS ONLY REQUIRED IF THE RULE RELIES ON SCIENTIFIC 
INFORMATION FOR ITS VALIDITY. 

PLEASE REMOVE THIS FORM PRIOR TO DELIVERY IF IT DOES NOT

APPLY TO THIS RULE FILING: 

Instructions• 

In completing the Scientific Information Statement, an agency shall provide a 
summary of the scientific information including reference to any scientific studies 

upon which the proposed rule is based, for the purpose of validity. 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3. BRIEF EXPLANATION OF SCIENTIFIC INFORMATION: 

4. CITATION OF SOURCE DOCUMENTATION OF SCIENTIFIC 

INFORMATION: 

5. INSTRUCTIONS ON HOW TO OBTAIN COPIES OF THE SOURCE 

DOCUMENTS OF THE SCIENTIFIC INFORMATION FROM THE AGENCY 

OR OTHER PUBLISHING ENTITY: 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Administrative Procedures 

Incorporation by Reference 

is ~~ s • ~ ~~ ,. 

THIS FORM IS ONLY REQUIRED WHEN INCORPORATING MATERIALS 
BY REFERENCE. PLEASE REMOVE PRIOR TO DELIVERY IF IT 

DOES NOT APPLY TO THIS RULE FILING: 

Instructions:

In completing the incorporation by reference statement, an agency describes any 

materials that are incorporated into the rule by reference and how to obtain copies. 

This form is only required when a rule incorporates materials by referencing another 

source without reproducing the text within the rule itself (e.g., federal or national 

standards, or regulations). 

Incorporated materials will be maintained and available for inspection by the Agency. 

1. TITLE OF RULE FILING: 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

2. ADOPTING AGENCY: 

Department of Public Safety & Plumbers Examining Board 

3. DESCRIPTIONDESCRIBE THE MATERIALS INCORPORATED BYREFERENCE~ 

IPC, International Plumbing Code, 2021 Edition 

Vermont Plumbing Rules, 2021 Edition 

4. FORMAL CITATION OF MATERIALS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE: 
Section 21 of these rules. 

S. OBTAINING COPIES: ~EXPLAINWHERETHEPUBLICMAYOBTAINTHEMATERIAL~S~ IN 

WRITTEN OR ELECTRONIC FORM, AND AT WHAT COST 

International Code Council 

shop.iccsafe.org/international-codes.html 

IPC, International Plumbing Code - $106.00 

The specific code information is also availible in a 

variety of printed and electronic formats at a variety 

of costs at the website address listed above. 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 1 



Administrative Procedures 

Incorporation by Reference 

6. MODIFICATIONSPLEASE EXPLAINANYMODIFICATION TO THE INCORPORATED 

MATERIALS E. G., WHETHER ONLY PART OF THE MATERIAL IS ADOPTED AND IF SO, WHICH 

PART~S~ARE MODIFIED 

Ammendments to the 2021 IPC are detailed in Section 21 

of these rules. Other modifications were also made, 

most specifically to changes in addresses and phone 

numbers for the Division of Fire Safety's Regional 

Offices. 

Run Spell Check 

Revised November 1, 2021 page 2 



~~r~~~~~,~.~ 
~-~~ 1 

VERMONT PL 
• ~ - • f s 

Effectfve Date ......'r.'~• 'T~T~~ 

G RULES 



- Table of Contents - 

Section 1: Purpose of the Rules... page 2 

Section 2: Scope of the Rules ... page 2 

Section 3: Definitions... page 2 

Section 4: Plumbers' Examining Board ... page 4 

Section 5: Commissioner of Public Safety. page 4 

Section 6: Duties of the Owner... page 5 

Section 7: Duties of the License Holder... page 6 

Section 8: License Examinations: 
8 (A) Master Plumbers... page 6 

8 (B) Journeyman Plumbers... page 6 

8 (C) Specialists Plumbers... page 7 

8 (D) Process for Examination... page 8 

8 (E) Examination not Required... page 8 

Section 9: Renewal of License... page 9 

Section 10: Plumbing License Fees... page 10 

Section 11: License not Required... pale 10 

Section 12: Complaints._ ~ pabe 11 

Section: 13: Disciplinary Proceedings... page 11 

Section 14: \~~ork Notices... page 12 

Section 15' Work Notice end .Inspection Fee... page 12 
_~ 

Section 1b: Inspection. of Pfumk~inp Installations. . . page L3 

Section 17: Connectinb Plumbing Installation.._ page 14 

Section 18: Priorities for Inspection, Review, and Investigation... page 14 

Section 19: Approval, Alternativesand Variances... page 15 

Section 20: Request for Reconsideration.,. page 15 

Section 21: Adoption of the =.+~-8 2022 International Plumbing Code (including VT amendments) ... page 15 

Section 2Z: Severability Claus... page 23 

Section 23: Effective Date... page 23 

Appendix (A) Vermont Plumbing Statute, 26 V.S.A. Chapter... page 24 

Appendix (B) Definition of a Public Building...page 25 

Appendix (C) Procedure for Disciplinary Proceeding... page 25 

Appendix (D) Asbestos... page 27 

Appendix (E) Design of Grease Interceptor... page 28 

Page 1 



Section 1: PURPOSE OF THE RULES 

The purpose of these rules is to protect and improve the general health and welfare of the people of 
the State of Vermont in the fields of environmental sanitation, water treatment, domestic supply and 
hydronically related hot water heating, by authorizing and enforcing rules and regulations for properly 
designed, acceptably installed and adequately maintained plumbing, watertreatment and hydronically 
related water heating systems and by licensing qualified plumbers and qualified heating and water 
treatment specialists. These rules are enacted in conformance with the Vermont statutes covering 
plumbers and plumbing. 

Section 2: SCOPE OF THE RULES 

(A) These rules shall apply to all public buildings, whet4~er connected to public water systems orpublic 
sewage systems, and to all other buildings or facilities connected to a public water or sewagesystem. 
This includes owner-occupied single-family ~. :~-€3E:es. Owner-occupied single family residences 
which are not on public water systems or publ~r~sewage systems do not require a work notice. 

Existing public buildings, and all other existing buildings or faci l~ies which are on , ublic water 
systems or public sewage systems must comply with these. rules whenever the plumbing in those 
buildings or premises is changed, replaced, or altered. Theseul~s shall not apply to existing private 
dwellings and public buildings except as the plumbing systems +n then, may be altered in the future. 

All new plumbing r~~~ . ; ~iywith the ._j.. ~ ~~-~1: ~ie~~~-nF _ ., ;~f ~ -~ . ~~:~~ Code. 

(B) Section 403.4.2 shal l apply to all new and existing single user toilet facility/room. 

Section 3: DEFINITIONS 

(A) The definitions sit out at 26 V.S.A. Section 2172 shal l t~~~applicable for these rules: 

(1) A "public water system" or "publ ic sewarage disposal system" shall mean any system supplying or 

servi«g 15 or more customers, each family, tenement, store, or other establishment being 
considered a single customer. 

(2) A "master plumber" shall rY~ean any person, licensed under this chapter, as a business, designs 

and/or installs plumbing systems, hires or employs a person or persons to do plumbing work, or 

supervises journeyman plumbers, or apprentice plumbers in completion of their work. Licensed 

master plumbers may perform all aspects of the trade under a specialist license without being 

required to obtain a specialist license. 

(3) A "journeyman plumber" shall mean any person licensed under this chapter who installs plumbing 

and water treatment or heating specialties under the direction of a master plumber. A journeyman 

plumber may supervise an apprentice employed by a master plumber and under the master 

plumber's direction. A journeyman plumber may perform all plumbing covered by a specialist 

Page 2 



license without being required to obtain a specialist license. A journeyman plumber shall not act as 

a master plumber. 

(4) An "apprentice plumber" shall mean any person, employed by a master plumber or under the 

direction of a master plumber or a journeyman plumber, who is engaged in learning and assisting 

in the installation of plumbing and water treatment or heating specialties under an apprenticeship 

program properly registered with the Vermont Apprenticeship Council. An apprentice plumber shall 

be supervised on the job by either a master or a journeyman plumber as per Vermont Department 

of Labor apprenticeship guidelines. 

(5) "Plumbing" isthe art of installing pipes, fixtures, and other apparatusfor bringing in the water supply 

and removing liquid and water carried wastes and dracnage venting systems within or on any 

building or structure. 

(6) "State plumbing inspector" means a master plumber or duly qualified employe of the department 

designated to enforce the rules and regulations pursuant to this chapter. 

(7) "Municipal inspector" means a plumbing inspector authorized to conduct municipal inspections 

pursuant to this chapter. 

~ . 
(8) "Specialist" means any person licensed under this cha{~ter who performs work in connection with 

water treatment and heating, or both, or perfor ~~s that work as a principal business or an auxiliary 

to a principal business far theperson's own account as designated on the ierson's license. 

(9) "Commissioner° rx~eans the commissioner ofthe Department of Public Safety. 

(10) "Legislative body" means the select board,. the alder board, city council or board of trustees of a 

municipality or an incorporated village. . ' 

(11j ''Work notice" means the notice required to be filed and validated under Section, 14 of these rules 

by a licensee prior to commencement of plu ibing work. 

(B) In addition,~far the purposes of these rules: 

1) "person" shall include any person or entity who performs plumbing work or is responsible for the 

performance of plumbing work under the jurisdiction of the Plumbers' Examining Board or the 

Department of Public Safety. 

2) "board" shall mean the Plumbers' Examining Board created by 26 V.S.A. 2181; 

3) "department" shall mean the Department of Public Safety. 

4) "public building" shall be as defined in 20 V.S.A. Section 2900. (Refer to appendix B for link to statute) 

Page 3 



5) "investigator" shall mean the person designated by the Department to work at the direction of 
theAssistant Attorney General on the investigating panel as detailed in Appendix C Section (a) (3). 

(12}. f~iAi(VTE[UACE. To keep existing plumbing fixtures and associated piping in good working order. 

Does nat include relocation of fixtures or piping. 

Section 4: PLUMBERS' EXAMINING BOARD 

(A) The Plumbers' Examining Board is comprised of 5 members: the Commissioner of Public Safety or 
designee; the Commissioner of Health or designee; a master plumber; a journeyman plumber; a public 
member not associated with the plumbing or heating trades. 

(B) By statute the Board is responsible for: adopting ~iumbing rules; licensing and disciplining 

plumbers. 

1) The plumbing rules the Board adopts must be m~t~imum per~armance standard's reasonably 

necessary for the protection of the public against recognized health hazards (26 V.S.A. Section 2173). 

The Board may adopt a nationally recognized plumbing code and amend it to suit Vermont in fulfilling 

its rule-making duties. 

2) The Board controls the issuance, suspension and revocation of plumbers' licenses. In order to 
exercise its powers and carry out its responsibilities the board ri~ay: 

(a) Conduct or otherwise provide examinations, and review and approve applications for licensure. 

(b) Investigate all matters within its jurisdiction. 

(c) Conduct hearings with regard to the administration of [ts affairs, including disciplinary hearings with 

regard to licensed persons; and, 

(d) Adapt rules consistent with its statutory authority.. 

(C) The put~lic may obtain information anc~rrake submissions or requests at the Board's office. The 

Board's office is located at the Department -~f Public Safety, Division of Fire Safety, 1311 US Route 302, 

Barre, VT 05641-2?51. 

Section 5: THE COII~VIISSI(3#'VVER OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

The Commissioner of Public Safety or a designated representative may: 
(A) Enter any public building or premises in which an installation subject to these rules is being or has 

been installed, replaced, or altered for the purpose of performing inspections necessary to carry out 

inspection responsibilities under these rules. 

(B) In accordance with 20 V.S.A. Section 2733, order a building or premises or any part of it closed until 

any unsafe condition or violation ofthese rules is corrected. Where appropriate, the Commissioner 

may order the demolition, removal, or disconnection of any plumbing systems or equipment 

deemed to constitute a hazard to persons or property. 

Page 4 



(C) Cause a written notice to be delivered to the owner of any property directing them to correct any 
condition where, in the opinion of the Commissioner or a plumbing inspector, that condition 
constitutes a violation of these rules. 

(D) Order the owner to stop work on the building or premises if the work on the plumbing systems in 
them are proceeding in contravention of these rules or are considered unsafe. 

(E) Direct tests of materials, devices, or assemblies made, or sufficient ~idence or proof be submitted, 
at the expense of the owner, where the evidence or proof is necessary to determine whether the 
material, device or installation method meets the requirements of these rules. 

(F) Revoke, amend, or refuse to issue a plumbing work notice where, in the opinion of the 
Commissioner or a plumbing inspector, the results of tests referred to Subsection (e) of this 
section are not satisfactory. ' 

(G) Order the removal of any plumbing systems or equipment installed in violation of these rules. 

(H) Prioritize inspections of plumbing systeirs based on the ~elati~e risks to persons or property arising 

from potential plumbing code violations: 

(I) Pursuant to 26 V.S.A. 2175(d), assess ari adr~~inistrative-penalty for each violation of this code. 

(J) Order any company s~~pplyir~ fuel service to the premises to disconnect the fuel supply until the 
cited violation has been removed ~r corrected, 

Section 6: DUTIES OF THE OWNER` 

The owner of the building or structure, or a designated ~:epresentative shall: 

(A) Nat install or maintain, ~- cause to be installed or maintained, any plumbing system or equipment 
which is unsafe or is likely to be unsafe to p,~rsons or property. 

(B) Observe these rules in all public buildings, or private residences on public water or sewer, which 
are under their control. 

(C) Allow the Commissioner or a plumbing inspector to enter any public building, or private residence 
on public water or sewer, at any reasonable time for the purposes of administering or enforcing these 
rules. 

(D) File a work notice and obtain a validated work notice required under Section 14 of these rules 
before anv plumbing work begins in asingle-family home connected to a public water or sewage 
system. 

Page 5 



(E) En~a~e the services of a properly licensed plumber to file a work notice and obtain a validated work 
notice as required under Section 14 ofthese rules before any plumbing work begins in a public building. 

Section 7: DUTIES OF A LICENSE HOLDER 

(A) Any person who has obtained a plumbing license under these rules shall: 

(1) Observe these rules regarding the installation of all plumbing work and the supervision of 
unlicensed employees. 

(2) Not begin plumbing work until a work notice for the work has been validated by the 
department. 

(3) Notify the department of a change of address. 

(4) Provide all information requested by the departrmer~t 

(B) Any licensed plumber who has filed a work notice shall: 

(1) Keep records which outline who has accomplished the work covered under a work notice. 
(2) Provide at least 5 working days' notice to the plumbing inspector for. .any required 

inspection. 

(3) Provide access for the plumbing inspector to all plumbing work and records subject to 
inspection. 

Section 8: LICENSE EXAMINATIONS 

To become licensed tca do plur7~bing work in the State of Vermont an applicant must meet the 
requirements established in the ~o~lawing sections: 

(A) Master Plumbers 

Any person who completes an appl ication for a master plura~ber's license, presents documentation of 

having. held a valid journey~~~an plumber's license under this chapter for a least 12 months, or 

documents equivalent training and experience in or o~~tside of this state acceptable to the board, and 
pays an examination fee in an amount determined by the board based on the costs associated with 
administering the examination, shal l be entitle to an examination. 

Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a licensing fee, the applicant shall 
receive a master plumber's license in the form of a wallet-sized card. The license shall be carried bythe 

master plumber at all times while performing the licensee's trade and shall be displayed upon request. 

Upon request of a license holder, a~ticense certificate, suitable for framing, shall be available for a fee. 

(B)lourneyman Plumbers 

Any person who completes an applscation for a journeyman plumber's license and documents 

apprenticeship in plumbing which includes both instruction and practice in work processes as verified 
by the Vermont apprenticeship council, or equivalent training and experience in or out of this state 

acceptable to the board, and pays an examination fee to be determined by the board based on the 

costs associated with administering the examination, shall be entitled to examination. 

Page 6 



Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a licensing fee, the applicant shall 
receive a journeyman plumber's license in the form of a wallet-sized card. The license shall be carried 
by the journeyman at all times while performing the licensee's trade and shall be displayed upon 
request. Upon request of a license holder, a license certificate, suitable for framing, shall be available 
for a fee. 

(C) Limited Licensure; Specialists 

Any person who completes an application for a specialist's license ar~d documents apprenticeship in 
plumbing which includes both instruction and practice in work processes as verified by the Vermont 
Apprenticeship Council, or successful completion of instruction, training and experience in or out of 
the state acceptable to the board and pays an examination fee be determined by the board based 
on the costs associated with administering the examination, shall be entitled to an examination. 
Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a license fee, the applicant shall 
receive a specialist license in the form of a wallet-sued card. The license shall bP carried by the licensee 
at all times while performing the licensee's specialty and shall be displayed upon r-eq uest. Upon request 

by the license holder, a specialist license suitable for~fra~ing shall he available for a f . A specialist 
license shall indicate each specialty for which the licensee has been approved. A specialist license does 
not take the place of any other license re'c{uired by law. 

Specialty fields for limited licenses include t°he following: 

(1) Water Heater Specialist: Installation, re9placement and re~ai ~ of any residential, industrial or 

commercial domestic hot water sup~aly tanks. 

(2) Heating System Specialist: Installation, replacement and repair of residential, industrial, or 

commercial hydronic space heating systems, including radiant, solar and other types of hydronic 
system design. Any~~vork on steam systems shall be l ir~~ited to steam systems with operating pressure 
not to exceed 15 P51. 

(3) Water Treatment Specialist: Installation, replacement, and repair of residential, industrial, or 

commercial potable water treatment and filtration equipment. 

A person duly licensed as a specialist under this section may perform specialty limited use work, either 

as an employee or as an independent contractor only in connection with the specialty field designated 

on the person's lice~~se. A specialist may perform a supply connection to an existing water supply for 

test and related system operation, but at no time shall any specialist perform any plumbing or heating 

work that is not specified or.~.ermitted under the specialist's license. 

The intent of these rules as they apply to the installation of fixtures and plumbing related to specialist 

licenses is to ensure the safety of the potable water supply. It is not the intent of these rules to regulate 

the operation, efficiency or consumer satisfaction of water heaters, hydronic heating systems, or water 

treatment equipment. The Vermont Fire and Building Safety Code and the Vermont Electrical Safety 

Rules regulate the safe operation of water heaters, hydronic heating systems, water treatment 

equipment and the related fuel or power source. 

Page 7 



(D) Process for Examinations 

(1) Each applicant for a license shall present to the executive office of the board on blanks furnished 

by the board, a written application for examination and license containing such information as the 

board may require, accompanied by the fee required. Examinations shall be in whole or in part in 

writing and shall include the theoretical and practical nature of plumbing or specialties, or both, 

and knowledge of state laws and department of health and environmental conservation regulations 

and such other regulations as the board may determine necessary ~~o satisfactorily determine the 

qualifications of the applicant. Examinations shall be relevant to the instructional material taught 

in classes, the codes used and new developments and procedures within the trade. 

(2) In order to carry out its responsibilities under this sectran the board many contract with a national 

testing organization to develop and administer a written plumbing exam. Any test fees charged by 

the testing organization are separate from the examination fee charged by the board and shall be 

paid directly to the testing organization. 

(3) Any individual who fails to achieve a; pissing grade on a plumbing licensing examination, after 

having taken the examination three tines, shall appear befare the board for the purpose of the 

board recommending further education, training andjor tutoring, prior to the applicant taking the 

test a fourth time. 

(4) See License procedure rn Appendix F. License testing is facilitated by a third-party vendor. 

(E) Examination not Required 

Appropriate licenses without examination may be issued to the following applicants upon payment of 

the required fee: 

ll  Reciprocal licenses - To a person to whom a master plumber's license, a journeyman plumber's 

license, or a specialist plumber's license has been previously issued by another state or municipality 

therein, provided that state or municipality therein maintains a standard of requirements 

equivalent to tt se of this state and who presents satisfactory proof to the board that he or she is 

a bona fide mater, journeyman, or specialist plumber. An applicant under this subsection shall be 

exempt from examination°only if he or she holds a license from a foreign state or municipality and 

if under the laws or .~egul~tions of the foreign state or municipality issuing the license a like 

exemption is granted to p{umbers duly licensed under the laws of this state. 

j~ Service Members and Veteran's - Except as otherwise provided by law, a iournevman's license shall 

be issued without examination and upon payment of requested fee to an applicant who is a service 

member or veteran who: 

Page S 



(1) submits a complete application and anv documentation required by the Board; 

(2) has received designation by the U. S. Armed Forces as a 12K Plumber or eauivalent: and 

(3) has completed a minimum of 8000 hours and four years of active duty field work as a 12K 
plumber or equivalent 

~} Universal Licensing: 

(a}(1) Apptopr~ate licenses r~viihc~ut examination rnay~ be is ~~ ;~~~ :~ ~ . ~~rsan tc~ ti~~ho~n a master plumber's license 
or a journeyman ~~lumbcr's license or a spe:cia.lty licen~c~ ; ui . ~, ?gas been. pre~~iously issued bs- another 
State or municipality upon the payment of the 3~equirc~_? ';_~ ~ i s 

(A} that state tzr ~nunicipali~~ maintained a stars,:. ~ . : ~,requirements equ~~ .:~ to t]lose of this State; and 

(B) the applicant presents satisfactory ~rooFto t~~.~ ~ ~1-_-t t6nt he or she is a boy ~ ~ ,,I licensee. 

i;. I .il~_' ~:1~~~)~ I~~1771 COffI ~J~ i.?~~ u I ~t~: ~:;:1 ~ C~.i~J~ ,'~~ fl !~', ~ )i~., .~_ _'. I IIC~LI ~Cc, lf1C C( f~LI~ IC LC `J'Jl l 1 II I :' ~'~J~J~[~t~~l . _. 

Tn~ ..c~~~~: i ~ ,~ ~~~ ~:c< <~ _, c ~~-:~ ~~no~:iul~ ~T Encr:~ ~ Go,~l> ~ Cu~,torr~ PoEfia! i oc,~~:~~, rauosoort~l~,. i~s~l 

Section 9: RENEWAL OF LICENSE 

(A)A license shall be valid fortwo ears. A notice of renewal and application for renewal of license shall 
be provided to each licensee prior to the expiration of the license. The application for renewalof 
license and the appropriate fee must be received by the department prior to the date the license 
expires. It is the res~aonsibility of the licensee to contact the licensing office for a renewal application 
in advance of expiration date if no renewal form is received prior to expiration date. 

(B) If a license has lapsed it may be renewed within 90 days of its expiration date along with a $15.00 
reinstatement fee in addition to the renewal free. 

(C) If a license is not renewed ~-vithin 90 days of expiration date the inactive licensee shall make 
application for reinstatement and shall appear before the board to request reinstatement. 

(D)Applicants for license renewal shall provide to the Board evidence of completion of 8 hours of 
continuing education or training, approved by the Board, within the previous 24-month period, at 
least 2 hours of which must include code review. A course or training program is valid for only one 
license renewal. A copy of the certificate is acceptable evidence of meeting the requirements for 
continuing education. 

(E) Approval of continuing education or training; 

(1) Sponsors of training courses shall submit for approval the following information: 

a) Sponsoring organization or individuals; 

b) Course content; 

Page 9 



c) Number of hours of eligible training; 
d) Instructors should be certified as a master plumber, engineer, plumbing inspector, 

vocational teacher with related experience, or otherwise acceptable by the Board; 
e) Date and place of instruction; 

f) Instructional materials to be used by attendees. 

(2) Subject matter shall deal with the adopted current plumbing codes, license renewal protocol or 
related information. This may include general or specific review 6f ti7e code, code changes from 
preceding versions, common violations of the code, or other related areas that relate to the 
specialty plumbing installation. 

(3) Tests at training programs are optional. 

(4) Upon completion of a course, certificates shall be issued to attendees and shall include: a) Sponsor's 

name 

b) Course title 

c) Date, place 

d) Hours completed 

e) Instructor's Signature 

f) Attendees' full name, license number. 

(F) Representatives of the Licensing Board and the Department of Publ ic Safety reserve the right to 

monitor all courses. 

Section 10: PLUMBING LICENSE FEES 

Plumbing l icense ar~d 2-year renewal fees' shall be as established under 26 V.S.A. Section 2193(c) 

asfollaws: 

(1) Master plumber license...$120 
(2) Journeyman plumber license...$30 
(3) Specialist license - per specialty field...$50 
(4) Master renewal fee...$120 
(5) Journeyman renewal fee...$90` 
(6) Specialist renewal fee - per specialty field...$50 
(7) License certificate...$10 

* Subject to fee change by Legislative Process 

Section 11: LICENSE NOT REQUIRED 

(A) All plumbing and specialty work performed in Vermont shall be performed by persons licensed 
under this chapter except that a license shall not be required for the following types of work: 

Page 10 



(1) Any plumbing and specialty work performed by an owner or the owner's regular employees in the 
owner-occupied freestanding single-family dwelling or in outbuildings accessory to the owner-

occupied, single family dwelling. 

(2) Installations of plumbing systems in laboratories for experimental purposes only. 

(3) A person who regularly employs a maintenance person whose duties include the maintenance of 

plumbing on the property of that person. 

(4) Plumbing or specialty installations performed as part of a training project of a vocational school or 

other educational institution. However, the installation shall be inspected. if the building is to be 

sold as a private dwelling or public building. 

(5) A person who performs miscellaneous jobs of manual labor on the person's oven property in the 

course of which plumbing repairs or alterations are made. 

(6) For the construction, repair or maintenance of buildings used exclusively for agricultural purposes 

and animal housing located on owner-occupiet arms. 

(7) Work performed by employees of any public or private water co~~pany, who in the main course of 

their employment irfistall,maintain or repair water supply pipes, ~~~eters or►control valves. 

Section 12: COMPLAINTS 

A person may file a co~7iplaint with the board by doing so in writing, setting forth a full statement of 

the facts concerning the al leged infraction of the plur~~ber's licensing statute or rules. In the event a 

complaint is filed with the Board, the Board's investigation shall not be limited to the matter set forth 

in the request for invest;gat;on but may extend to any act coming to the attention of the board which 

appears to violate the statute or these rules. 

Section 13: DISCIPLINARY PRQCEEDINGS. 

(A) In accordance with 26 V.S.A. section 2181, the board may revoke or suspend a license, or refuse to 

renew a license. This,shail not prelude the board from taking lesser steps, including, but not limited 

to formal reprimand, or required~-further education and training. The board may act for any of the 

following reasons: 

(1) Fraud or deceit in obtaining a license. 

(2) Gross negligence, incompetency, misrepresentation, or misconduct by a licensee. 

(3) Violation by a licensee of the rules of the Department of Health, the Department of Public Safety 

Board 

(4) Failure to comply with a written notice issued under sections 2173, 2174 or 2175 of this title. 

Page 11 



(B) The board may take these actions only after notice and provision to the licensee of an opportunity 
to appear before the board for a hearing, in accordance with 3 V.S.A. Chapter 25, the Vermont 
Administrative Procedure Act, and these rules issued thereunder. 

(C) The board and department will proceed with initiating a complaint against a licensee, investigation 
of the complaint, action and hearings as described in Appendix C. 

Section 14: WORK NOTICES 

(Aj A work notice shall be filed with the department for all plumbing work covered by these rules and 
be validated by the department, prior to the start of such work, in order to facilitate the inspection 
process authorized by 26 V.S.A. 2199. The term "Pe~r~t9t" as used in the ~93~ 2Q21 International 
PlumbingCode (IPC) shall have the same meaning as "Work Notice validated by the department". 

(B) The department may refuse to validate a work notice if the license holder has other ongoing 
plumbing work for which a work notice has not b~ee~t1 filed, if~he department is awed fees or 
penalties, or if requested by the Plumbers' Examining Board pursuant to 26 V.S.A. 2181(•c . 

(C) A work notice is not required for plumbing work described as follows: 

(1) Delete and replace Replacement of a plur~~bing fixture/appliance by a similar fixture/appliance 
utilizing existing water supply, waste lines, source of fuel and venting termination if the 

fixture/appliance being replaced meets currently adopted codes and is not being moved to a new 
location 

(2) Maintenance or repair within an exiting plumbing fixture; 

(3) Replacement of water supply and waste lines ~vithQut relocation or installation of new plumbing 
fixtures. 

(D) The department ray accept an annual plumbing work notice where plumbing installation work is 

ongoing in an existing building. A plumbing work notice filed under this section shall include the name 

and location of the building, the l icensed plumber responsible for the work and the payment of the 

minimum fee. The acceptance of an annual plumbing work notice does not modify the requirements 
for licensure or supervision as established under these rules. 

(E) A validated work notice shall expire if the plumber of record ceases work authorized under the 

work notice is not commenced, or is suspended or abandoned, for a time period of 180 days. 

Section 15: SCHEDULE OF WORK NOTICE AND INSPECTION FEES 

(A) Fees established by the legislature under 26 V.S.A. Section 2175(a) shall be paid to the 

Commissioner or a designated representative prior to the validation of a work notice. 

(1) For all plumbing work, identified as a priority for inspection and review under Section 18 of these 

rules, the fee shall be: 

Page 12 



(a) $10 for each plumbing fixture/appliance/device described as a washing machines, dishwashers 
grease, oil, sand, or neutralizing interceptors, sewage ejector pumps, water closets, urinals, bidets, 
disposal, drinking fountains or bottle fillers, water cooler, lavatories, bathtubs, showers, sinks, disposals, hose 
bibbs, eye washes or emergency showers, floor drains, raof drains, floor sinks, Water meters, backflow 
prevention devices, pressure reducing valves or similar device. The total shall not be less than $50. 

(b) $15 for each plumbing fixture described as a water heaters, ~' _ :, ~~~stic hot water coils, Plate 
Exchangers, (boilers, or hydronic unit heat: :: j,`domestic hot water coil, solar 
panels, geothermal heat pumps, water treatment, pumps, thermal expansion or pressure tanks, 
thermostatic ~^'^^nn~~~~ ~~~ ~~*f ~~'-^^' mixing valves, Domestic. ~ ;',, . ' ,r Heads ar Systems, or water 
treatment. Vi e-

2) For all plumbing work, not identified as a priority for inspection and review under Section 18 ofthese 
rules, the fee shall be $50. 

(B) At the discretion of the Commissioner, whenever an owner or licensed plumber requests for the 
owner's or licensed plumber's benefit t eat an inspection be made outside ofthe normal working hours, 
all fees payable by the owner under this section shall be paid ~n an amount twice that indicated under 
this section. 

Section 16: INSPECTION OF PLUMBING INSTALLATIONS 

The process for inspection and review of plumbing word, identified as a priority for inspection and 
review under Section 18 of these ~~ules, shall be as follows: 

(A) PLANS 

Plumbing plans are not~equi~-ed for the plumbing work vered under these rules unless, in the opinion 
of the Commissioner or a designated representative, the job is of sufficient size or complexity to 
warrant such plans. 

(B) ROUGH INSPECTIONS 

A plumbing systei~~ installed under these rules shall not be covered unless it is first inspected by a 
plumbing inspector. The provisions of this section may be specifically waived by a designated 
representative. 

(C) FINAL INSPECTIONS 

(1) Upon completion of a new plumbing installation, the applicant shall request a final inspection by a 
plumbing inspector. Within 5 working days of the receipt ofthe inspection request, the Commissioner, 
or designated representative, shall conduct an inspection, establish a reasonable date for inspection, 
or issue a waiver of inspection. 

Page 13 



(2) The plumbing inspector may waive the presence of the licensee who filed the work notice for rough 
and final inspections. 

Section 17: CONNECTING INSTALLATIONS 

New plumbing installations shall not commence unless a work notice has been validated by the 
department. ~ 

Section 18: PRIORITIES FOR INSPECTION, REVIEW AND INVESTIGATION 

Priorities for inspection, review and investigation are established, consistent with 26 V.S.A. 2173 (b), 
based on the type and size of the building, the complexity of the plumbing work and consideration of 

health risks to persons or property resulting from potential plumbing code violations, as follows: 

(A) Priority inspection and review work based on use: 

(1) Plumbing work involving commercial food preparatiori and food process areas. 

(2) Plumbing work involving special hazards i~a commercial operations such as Automotive repair 

garages, car wash, laundry, dry clea~iirig, funeral home, laboratory, or industrial hazardous 

waste discharge. 

(3) Plumbing work d~`~e in facilities where the occupants may be most vulnerable to risk such as a 
hospital, nursing home, health center, doctor or dentist's office, beauty parlor, day care or 

elementary or secondary school 

(4) Plumbing work involving public swimming pools, public spas and hot tubs. 

(5) Plumbing work done in bui ldings cflhtaining ~~~ultiple dwelling units, including hotels, motels 

and inns. 

(6) Plur~~bing work do~~e in buildings or having an occupant load of 300 or more persons or where 

r~~ulti-user style bathrooms are~nstalled. 

(B) Priority for investigations in descending order of priority: 

(1) Complaints alleging serious plumbing violations. 

(2) Plumbing ti-vork being done by non-licensed persons. 

(3) Plumbing work bestig done where no work notice has been filed with the Department. 

(4) Complaints alleging non-serious plumbing violations. 

(C) Plumbing work not listed as a priority in subsection (A) or (B) above is required to be installed and 

completed in accordance with these rules and is subject to random inspection and enforcement 

actions by the State Plumbing Inspector. 

(D) All plumbing work in a building shall be classified as priority plumbing work where both priority and 

non-priority plumbing work occur on the same water and/or waste water systems. 

Page 14 



Section 19 APPROVAL, ALTERNATIVES, AND VARIANCES 

The approval of materials, equipment and devices and alternatives and variances to this code, shall be 
in accordance with Section 105 of the ~ 20211nternational Plumbing Code. 

Section 20: REQUEST FOR RECONSIDERATION 

A person aggrieved by an interpretation of these rules, or the result of any inspection or an order to 
correct code violations may request that the Commissioner or designated representative reconsider 
such refusal or order. A request for reconsideration shall be made within 15 days after receipt of 
written notice of such refusal or order. The Commissioner or designated representative shall review 
the refusal or order within 30 days of the date the request for reconsideration is received. The 
Commissioner or designated shall issue an order amend~iig, modifying or affirming the prior refusal or 
order as circumstances require within 30 days of th~date of the review. A person aggrieved by the 
decision under this section may appeal to the superior court. 

Section 21: ADOPTION OF A NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED GODE: 

THE ~A-~8 2021 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

(A) Under 26 V.S.A. Section 2173, the board adopts the provisions of the ~~ 2021 International 
PlumbingCode (hereinafter referred to as _ I PC). All plumbing installations shall comply with 

the 2021 IPC, as amended i~ this section t~ meet the individual needs of Vermont. The deletion 
of certain articles aid sections of the ?~ 20211PC has been necessary to ensure consistency with 
existing regulatory authority. The failure to incorporate these codes in their entirety should not be 
construed ~inimizethe value of these Codes as effective standards with current technology. 

All references to tka~ International Building Code, lnternatianal Residential Cade (IRC), the 

Intematianal Fuel Gas Cade or the International Mechanical Code in the 2021 IPC are deleted and 
replaced with the current Vermont Fire and BuildingSafety Code, including NFPA 31, 54, 58 and 211 

http://firesafetv.vermont.~ov 

Food and lodging Service Establishments shall conform to Vermont Health Department regulations 

(800-439- 8550) htt : /~healthve~mont.~ov. 

Public and private water systems, and underground injection control shall conform to the regulations 

of the Agency of Natural Resources (ANR) Drinking Water and Ground Water Protection Division 

(802-828-1535) http:drinkin~water.vt.~ov/. 

Stormwater management shall conform to the regulations of ANR's stormwater program. (802-828-

1535) ~~^~ ~+^~ , ht~s;~ldec.vermont.~ov/watershed 

Page 15 



(B) Add, amend, delete and replace as follows: 

-delete and replace - Section 101.1 Title: These rules shall be known ass the ~ 2021 
Vermont Plumbing Rules (hereinafter referred to as "this code"). 

-delete and replace- Section 101.2: Scope: The design and installation of plumbing systems 
including sanitary and storm drainage, sanitary facilities and tirater~ supplies, storm water 
and sewage disposal, located within the building and the connecting pipes within 10 feet 
of the building, shall comply with the requirements of this code. The design and 

installation of gas piping and the design and installationof fire sprinkler and standpipe 
systems shall be in accordance with the Vermont Fire acid Building SafetyCode. 

-delete - Section 101.3 

-delete and replace- Section 102.2 Existing Installations: Exist .public buildings, and all 

other existingbuildings or facilities must comply with these rules whenever the plumbing 

in those buildings or premises is changed, replaced, or altered as required by section 

102.4. 

-delete- Section 103 ~ ' ~-~! ~~+r~~~ ~ ~i~ C~ ~~7~ t ~-~~~~r~oliance Agency 

-delete and replace- Section 104: D~~ties and Fo~vers of the bode Official: The 

Commissioner of the department of Public Safety ar designee shall be designated as the 
code official for the purpose of thiscode. Tfie code official shall have the authority to 
render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and procedures to clarify the 
application of its provision"s: Such interpretations° policies and procedures shall be in 
compliance with the intent and purpose of this code. 

-delete- Section 10b Permits: Except for ~8 106.5.7 Posting of Permit: The permit (work 

notice) or a copy shall be kept on the site of the work until the completion of the project. [Note: 
See sections 14 and 15 of these rules in regards to work notices] 

-delete and replace- Section _'~~108.2 Required Inspections and Testing: The holder of 
the permit shall be responsible for notifying the code official to schedule inspections 

required by these rules and ocher inspections and testing as required by sections' 
108.2.1 through and including 3-O~~ 108.4.3 

-delete- Section 109 Fees 

-delete- Section 115 Violations 

-delete- Section 3-O~ 114 Means of Appeal: [Note: See section 20 in regard to reconsideration] 
-delete — APPENDIX F: BOARD O~ APPEALS: [Note: See section 20 in regard to reconsideration] 

Page 16 



-amend - Section 202 General Definitions 

M • • r; • ra a ~': 

. • s • w t 

LEAD-FREE PIPE AND FITTING. See Chapter 605.2.1 Pipe and fittings used for human 
consumption(water for drinking or cooking) shall meet the most recent NSF/ANSI 
low lead standard (<0.25%weighted average lead content-wetted surface). For 
additional information contact the office of the Attorne~General at (802-828- 3171) or 
AGO. lead state. vt. us. 

See also http://a~o.vermont.~ov/assets/files/~eadiriPlumbin~.pdf 

MAINTENANCE. To keep existing plumbing fr;: '~~~~ ̀ sand associ^tpd piping in ~;c ~~~' +.nrorkrng order. 
Does not include relocation of fixtures or piping: 

PLUMBING. The art of installing pipes, fixtures and other apparatus for bringing in the 
water supply and removing liquid and water carried wastes and drainage venting systems 
within or on any buildingor structure. 

-delete-Section 301.3 exception (refer to Agency Natural Resources (ANR) regulations). 

-delete and replace- Section 302.2 Industrial Wastes: Waste products from manufacturing 
or industrialoperation introduced into the public sewer system are regulated by the 
Vermont Agency of Natural Resources: 

-delete- Section 305.x.1 Sewer depth (refer to A ncy Natural Resources (ANR) regulations) 

-delete and replace- Section 311 Toilet Facilities for Workers: Toilet Facilities for Workers 
are regulatedby the Vermont Depart~r,en~t of Labor (VOSHA). 

-delete and r lace- Section 313.1 Equipment Efficiencies: Equipment efficiencies are 
regulated underthe Commercial Building Energy Standards, as adopted by the Vermont 
Department of Public Service. 

-add- Section ~4:~ 314.2.1.2 All condensate disposal shall conform to ANR regulations (802-
828-1535). 

-amend- Table 403.1 The minimum water closet and lavatory requirement for restaurants, 
banquet halls and food courts shall be in accordance with the Health Regulations for Food 

Page 17 



Service Establishments adopted by the Department of Health. 
For access to Health Regulations for Food Establishments 
refer to; http://www.healthvermont.~ov/about-us/laws-regulations/rules-and-regulations 

-add- Section 403.1.1.1 Gender Free Restrooms and Required Fixture Counts: When a new 
gender freerestroom is provided in an occupancy that has the total number of required 
plumbing fixtures set forth in the plumbing code and is fixed separately for both men and 
women, the fixtures in the new genderfree restroom shall be deducted from the total 
required fixture count of either the men's or women'srestroorns. 

_ -add — Section 403.4.2 Single-user restroom signage: Single-user toilet facility/room shall 
be provided with a sign "RESTROOM". Signage far Accessible toi{et facility/room shall 
comply with the Vermont Access Rules. 

-delete and replace- Section 404 Accessible plumbing facil;ties: Accessible plumbing 
a 

facilities and fixtures shall be provided in accordance with the-Vermont Access Rules. 

-amend- Section 4~-}:~ 412.1 Faucets and other fittings shall meet the most recent 
NSF/ANSI low lead standard (<0.~5%weighted average lead content —wetted surface). 

-delete - 412.10 Head Shampoo sink ~ . . , .. ~ ~ ~ he . ~ ~ ~ -~rmin~ to ASSE 1082. 

-add- Section 424.3 waterless urinals: the installation~of tivate~(ess urinals are permitted, 
subject to theprior approva) of the Plumbers Examining Board guidelines. 

-add-Section ~E~ ~. ~ ;; ' ' ~,; .;~-+~-; ,01.1.1 -I- tl~i~~ERATURE CONROL FOR HOT WATER 
r _ . '"i ~,'` . i ~ ~, ~~~~Jca~. . -, '. ~c ; s*. ~:r~ safety devices may be required. 
Water heats; tank style and tankless; shalt be equipped with an ASSE 1017 
Temperature actuated mixing valve in accordance with 602.2. 

-amend-Section 501.2 Water heater as space heater. Where a combination potable water 
and space heating system requires water for space heating at temperatures higher than 
120°F (49`C), a temperature actuated mixing valve complying with ASSE 1017 shall be 
provided to l imit the water supplied to the potable hot water distribution system to a 
temperature of 120°F (~9`C) or less. The potability of the water shall be maintained 
throughout the system. 

-delete and replace- Section 501.6 Water temperature control in piping from tankless 
heaters: The temperature of water from tankless water heaters shall be a maximum 120°F 
(49°C) after the temperature actuated mixing valve when intended for domestic uses. This 
provision shall not supersede the requirement for protective shower valves in accordance 
with Section 412.3. 

Page 18 



-add-Section 503.3 Water Heater Connections: All connections to the water heater including the 

ASSE 1O17 temperature actuated mixing valve and the full port cold water shut off valve shall be 
rigidly supported using code compliant metallic piping. Metallic piping must extend a minimum of 

three feet or greater from both the hot and cold water connection points. 

-amend- Section 5O4.4 Relief Valve: Thermal expansion shall be controlled in accordance 

with Section 6O7.3 

-delete and replace- Section 5O4.6.13 Material for Discharge Piping: Piping shall be 

constructed ofinetallic materials listed in section 6O5.4 or ASME 12.4.1. 

-add- 5O4.6 (15) Outlet of all relief valve piping shall~e cut on a 45 degree angle. 

- delete and replace- 602.2 Potable water re~~,ired: Only potable water shall be supplied 

to plumbing fixtures that provide water for drinking, bathing or culinary purposes, or for 

the processing of food, medical or pharmaceutical products. Unless otherwise required by 

law, potable watershall be suppliedto all plumbing fixtures at a maximum temperature of 

12O°F (49°C). 

-add- 6O2.3 Individual water supply systems are alsq regulatedby Vermont Agency of 

NaturalResources. r~~~~- r~,~rt~o page 15~.~ ':~°~JR i ~~~~, ;~ 

-add in part- Section 602.3.4 Disinfection of system; After c~astruction or major repair, the 

individual watersupply system shall be purged of deleterious matter and disinfected in 

accordance with Section 610. 

-amend- 5ectian 603.2 Separation of water service and building sewer: Water service pipe 

and thebuildin~ sewer- shall be separated by 10 feet (3O48 mm) of undisturbed or compacted 

earth. 

-amend- Section 6O3.2 delete "not less than 12 inches (3O5 mm)" and replace with "not less 

than 18 inches (458 mm)". 

-amend- Section 6O3.2 delete "at least 5 feet (1524 mm)" and replace with "at least 1O 

feet (3O48 mm)i~om the sewer pipe centerline." 

-amend- Table 6O4.3 

Shower ~5 2.O at 8 psi 

Shower, balanced pressure, thermostatic, or ~5 2.O at 2O psi 

Combination balanced-pressure/thermostatic 

Mixing valve 

Page 19 



-add- Section 604.4 Exception 6. In new construction, low flow water closets with a flow 
rate of 1.28 gallons per flush as outlined in the Vermont Residential Energy Code may be 
used in lieu of the maximum flow rate of 1.6 gallons per flush as outlined in Table 604.4 
of the International Plumbing Code. 

-amend- Table 604.4 
Lavatory, private ~~ 1.5 gpm at 60 psi 
Shower head ~ 2.C} gpm at 80 psi 
Sink Faucet ~ 1.8 gpm at 60 psi 

-amend- Section 604.7 Inadequate water pressure: Water pressure .booster systems are 
also regulatedunder the Vermont Water Supply Rules; chapter 21, as adopted by the 
Vermont agency of natural resources. [Ref, ., p~; ;a 15 far ANR infix.] 

-amend- Table 605.3 Delete copper orcopper-alloy tubing of types M and WM as approved 
material. 

-amend- Table 605.4 Copper and copper-alloy tubing of types M and WM are 
restricted to above-grade use only. 

-amend- Section 606.5 1Nater pressure booster systems: Water pressure booster 
systems are also regulated underthe Vermont Public water Supply Rules, as adopted by 
the Vermont Agency of NaturalResources. [~;- ~ _ r,: ~ page 15 for tiNR info.] 

-add — Section 607.5 Pipe Insulation; Install in accordance with VT Energy Standards. For 
additional information contact the Vermont ' ~~~ --, ~~_rk~~~ ~EnergyCode Hotline at 
855-877-0673 or htt~:~_ ~`/~~~ubl ic~cr~~ice.ve,~r~i~~nt ,nvteai3ter~t,~bul~~srz~-enemy-sta+~c~drds 

-amend- Section 608.1 Plur~~bing under the scope of these rules shall also conform to the 
Vermont Water Supply Rules, as adored by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources, 
in regard to the prevention of cross-connections. [Refer to page 15 for ANR info.] 

-add — 608.1. -:°.`~Ilatio;-~ c; r 3ackflow Assemblies shall be in accordance with ASSE Backflow 
Pre~entior~ Refier~. ~:.~ i' ! or AWWA Backflow Prevention and Crass-connection Central: 
Recommended Prac~'_ -- ~: X14. 

-add- Section ~8~ 608.9.1— equivalent wording and signage acceptable to code official 

-delete and replace- Section ~9~8-~ 608.18 Protection of individual water supplies: 

Individual water supplies are regulated by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources. 

-add- Section 610.1; or repaired 

Page 20 



-delete and replace- Section 610.1 {4} Repetition of Disinfection: The procedure shall be 
repeated where shown by a bacteriological examination that contamination remains 
present in the system. Consecutive bacteriological samples must betaken 24 hours apart 
before the water system is put back into service. 

-amend — Section 612.1 Solar Systems: in accordance with the Vermont Plumbing Rules 

-amend - Section 613.1 Temperature-actuated mixing 1~a i~w :_ ~. ? emperature-actuated mixing 
valves, are required to be installed to reduce water tF ~ ,- _.~~. . `r~ defined limits. These valves 
shall comply with AS5E 1017 and are required to h~ ~r~ _ :pied at ~~ - ; ~ ~t water source. 

-delete and replace- Section 701.2 Sewer required: Every building in which plumbing 
fixtures are installed shall be connected tc~ a public or private sewerage system. Public 
and private sewerage systems are regulated by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources. 

-delete and replace- Section 701.4 Sewage Treatme"nt: Sewage treatment is regulated by 
the VermontAgency of Natural Resources. 

_~'~'^~^ ^nom' ~^n'~r^ _add- Section 701.8 Drainage piping in foQr! service areas: Waste 
piping above any working, storage or eating surfaces in food service establishments shall 

be suitably protected to prevent contarr~i~ation from leakage. 

-delete- Section 70Z.Z Table— Polyethylene (PE) Plastic Pipe 
-delete- Section 702.4 Table — Polyethylene (PE) Plastic Pipe 
-delete- Section 702.7 Lead ber~~ls and traps. 

-amend- Section 703.1 Building pipe. Delete installed within 5 feet (1524 mm) of 
the water service" & replace with "installed within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the water 
service.°

-add - Section 704.5 Deed Ends: Drainage piping shall not be installed or altered that 

creates a dead end section of piping. Cleanout extensions and piping for future fixtures 

shall not be considered as a deadend. 

-delete-Exception in Section 705.10.2 

-delete and replace — Section 705.16.4 Plastic pipe or tubing to other piping material: 

Joints between different types of plastic pipe and/or other piping material shall be made 
with an approved adapter fitting. Joints between plastic pipe and cast-iron hub pipe shall 

be made by caulked joint or a rr~ri~compression joint. 

Page 21 



-delete- 708.1.5 Cleanout Size - Exception (2) 

-add- 803.3 Special Wastes System Design: Add "and shall conform to ANR regulations". 

-delete and replace — Section 903.1.1: Roof Extension "All open vent pipes that extend through 
a roof shall be terminated at least 6" but not more than 12"above the roof." 

-add- 903.1.1.1 Vent penetration through roof shall be pro` -_ against shear force. 

-delete in part- 903.2 — not less than 1 foot (305mm) 

-delete and replace- Section 904.3 Vent Termination: Vent stacks or stack vents shall 
terminate outside the building to the open air. 

-add- Section 906.1(.1} Size of stack vents and vent stacks: Every building shall have at 
least one 3-inch continuous stack vent or 3-inch continuotas vent stack that extends to 
outside the building. 

-add- Section 906.6 Horizontal branch vents: Horizontal branch vents within unheated 
areas shall be protected against free•z;ng. 

-add- Section 917.1.1 Single Stack Vent S~rstem: Single stack vent syst~ns may not be used in 
single familyhomes. Single stack vent systems rn all, other occupancies may only to be used 
for engineered systems when approved by the pltar7~bing inspector. 

-delete end replace- Section 918.1 Ger~eeral. Air Admittance Valves: Vent systems utilizing 
air admittance valves for~~~,dividual and branch-typeair admittance valves shall conform 
to ASSE 1051. Stack-type airadmittance valves are not permitted. 

-amend- Section 918.3 Delete last $entente: Stack vents and vent stacks shall be 
permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance valves.in accordance with Section 
918.3. Z. 

-delete- Section 918.3.2 Stacks. 

-delete and replace- Section 918.7 Vent required: Within each plumbing system, a 
minimum of one continuous 3 inch stack vent or one continuous- 3 inch vent stack shall 
extend outdoors to the open air. 

-delete and replace - Section 1002.6 —Building Traps. Building house traps shall be prohibited, 

Page 22 



except where local conditions necessitate such traps. Building traps shall be provided with aclean-out 
and a relief vent of fresh air intake on the inlet side of the trap. The size of the relief vent or fresh air 
intake shall not be less than one-half the diameter of the drain to which the relief vent or air intake 
connects. Such relief vent of fresh air intake shall be carried above grade and shall be terminated in a 
screened outlet located outside the building. 

- add- Section 1003.1 Interceptors and Separators: External interceptors and separators located 
morethan 10 feet from the building are regulated by the Agency cff Natural Resources. 

-delete -Section 1003.3.7 Gravity Grease Interceptors and gravity grease interceptors with fat oils and 
grease disposal systems. Refer to ANR Rules. 

-delete and replace- Section 1101.2 Disposal. Storm drainage for a building roof or courtyard shall be 
regulated by this section. Storm drainage from paved areas, yards and courts are regulated by Agency 
of Natural Resources Watershed Management Division, stormwater program (802-828-1535). 

-add in part- Section 1109.1 General: 1Nhere the public sewer is a cor7~bined system for both 
sanitaryand storm water, the storm sewer shall be connected independentlytothe public sewer 
in accordanceto Agency of Natural Resources Rules. 

~ ~ 

-delete and replace , ';~3;~ _ ! -- 4pecial Pipi~-~~ ~:- i ~,r~ r a~,: = ~:n~:: 
Section 120 ' , . _~"~ ~r~ ~~ f medical ga ~-< <c; 1'~dFP~.. ~~ ~ ~~..IdD ASSE 6000 
(Health Care ~a~, - i~i~°;l ` 
Section 1203.1 ~. ~ ~ ~ i ~ ~ , 'ation: Nonn~~ . ' '`=al oxygen systems refer tc~ NFPA 51 & NFPA SS 

-add- Section 1301.1.1 Non-potable Water Syster~~s: Contact Agency of Natural Resources Drinking 
Water andGrounct~vater Protection Division for prior approval. 

-[delete - ~i~ ; ~:; ar 14: Subsur ~.~raywat~ soil Absorption Sysfiems: 

Section 22: SEVEt~►BILITY CLA~JSE 

In the event any dart or provision of these rules is held to be illegal, this shall not have 
the effect ofmaking void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions of these rules. 

Section 23: EFFECTIVE DATE ~'"~ ~ ~~=~n~ ~~~l~ }~~~ ~~fa~t ~.~'„ 7 ~ °~^7 °_ These rules shall take effect 
[put in date here] 

Page 23 



APPENDIX (A) THE VERMONT PLUMBING LAW 26 V.S.A. CHAPTER 39 

For full text please refer to: https://legislature.vermont.gov/statutes/chapter/26/039 

§ 2171. Purpose 

§ 2172. Definitions 

§ 2173. Rules adopted by the board 

§ 2174. Municipal rules and regulations; municipal inspections 

§ 2175. Work notice; fees; enforcement; appeals; penalties 

§ 2176. Existing buildings 

§ 2181. Plumber's examining board; membership; powers 

§ 2182. Terms of office 

§ 2183. Fees; books and records 

§ 2184. Per diem pay and expenses 

§ 2191. Master plumbers 

§ 2192. Journeyman plumbers 

§ 21,92a. Limited iit-insure; specialists 

§ 2193. Applications and examinations; fees 

§ 2194. Examinations not required; temporary licenses 

§ 2195. Expiration and renewal; renewal; reinstatement; continuing education 

§ 2197. Penalty 

§ 2198. Exceptions; license not required 

§ 2199. Inspections 

Page 24 



APPENDIX (B) DEFINITION OF PUBLIC BUILDING - 20 V.S.A 2900(8) 

-add- For full text refer to; httgs://le~islature.vermont.~ov/statutes/section/20/174/02900 

APPENDIX (C) PROCEDURE FOR LICENSING DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURE 

(A) INITIATING A COMPLAINT AGAINST A LICENSEE 

(I) Form of complaint: Filing. A person may register a complaint against a plumber licensed by the 
Plumbers' Examining Board by filing a written complaint witf~ the Department of Public Safety, Division 
of Fire Safety, r~~= ~1~ ~~~e ~9~, ~~rK^~T, 85~4~ -+5 St_«e Drive ~.~. - -~ bury, VT 05671. The 
written complaint must set forth, at a rrinimum, the nature, date, and place~of the alleged 
violations. The board may also initiate a license review procedure on its own motion by filing a 
complaint with the department. 

(2) Verification. Upon receipt of a complaint, the department will verify the Vermont license number 
of the person against whom the complaint is lodged. If the person is unlicensed and the complaint 
alleges criminal conduct, the department will refer the complaint to the Office of the Attorney General. 
If the person is a licensee of the board, the department will docket the complaint and open an 
investigation file under the name and license nurl~ber of t`he person. 

(3) Investigating Panel. An investigating panel consisting of an investigator designed by the 
department and an assistant attorney general will be formed upon the docketing of a complaint. The 
assistant attorney general assigned to the case wiU head the panel and supervise the investigation of 
the complaint. 

(B) INITIATING THE INVESTIGATIQN. 

(1) Notice to the Attorney General and to the Investigator. Upon docketing the complaint, the 
department will send a copy 4f all materials contained in the newly opened file, including a copy of the 
complaint, ~o the attorney general,. and notifythe attorney general of the name, address and phone 
number of its designated investigator. The department will also send copies of the materials to the 
investigator and inform the investigator of the name of the division chief in the attorney general's 
office responsible for the investigation. 

(2) Notice to the Licensee. ~he~department will send written notice of the initiation of an investigation 

to the licensee against whom the complaint has been filed. The notice shall include a copy of the 
complaint and a copy of the statute and these rules. The notice will inform the licensee that inquiries 

or materials regarding the investigation should be addressed to the investigating panel at the address 

of the department. 

(3) Notice to the Board. The department will send written notice to the Board indicating that an 

investigation has been instituted regarding a licensing complaint. 

Page 25 



(4) The inspector assigned to investigate the complaint shall inspect the work which is the subject of 
the complaint and interview the complainant. The inspector may also meet and interview the licensee 
at the direction of the assistant attorney general assigned to the matter. 

(C) RECOMMENDED ACTION. 

(1) At the conclusion of the investigation the assistant attorney general assigned to the matter shall 
make a recommendation as to whether formal proceedings should commence against the licensee. 

(2) If formal disciplinary proceedings are recommended, the a~"sistant attorney general shall submit a 

complaint describing the alleged violations, and the rules or statutes violated, with the 

recommendation. 

(3) If the licensee is willing to admit to the changes the assistant attorney general may explore the 

possibility of a stipulated settlement. A stipulated settler~~ent must be approved by the board. 

(4) If no disciplinary action is recommended the case tivill be closed and the complainant and the 
license will be notified that no further action will be taken at~this time. The matter may be reopened if 

new evidence is presented. 

(D) FORMAL HEARING BY THE BOARD. 

(1) Notice and Place of Hearing. Upon the filing of a iaatice of charges by the investigating panel, the 

board will commence the hearing process byeserving the notice'~f charges and a notice of the 

hearing upon the licensee. Notice will be served personally or by certified mail, return receipt 

requested. Copies wi l l be sent to the members ofthe if~vestigating panel and the complainant. The 

hearing will be scheduled at least 20 days after service: 

(2) Failure to Appear. If the licensee fails to appear after proper notice has been given, the board shall 

hold the hearing and make a decision on the charges. 

(3) A quorum of the board shall be a majority of its members. 

(4) Conduct of Hearing; Receipt of~Evidence; Argument. The board may admit any evidence it deems 

of a type commonly relied upon by reasonably prudent persons in the conduct of their affairs. All 

persons shall testify under oath or affirmation. The licensee or his attorney may examine, or cross 

examine witnesses, inspect documents, and explain or rebut any evidence presented to the board. 

The assistant attorney general, investigator, and licensee may present oral and written argument in 

addition to evidence, which also shall be made part of the record. 

Where a licensee is not represented by counsel the board shall advise the licensee and aid in the 

examining and cross examining of witnesses as effectively as possible compatible with the impartial 

discharge of its duties as a body of impartial review. 

Page 26 



(5) Authority of the Chair. The chair shall administer oaths to witnesses, rule on questions of evidence 
and upon the service of subpoenas and other notices and do whatever is necessary and proper to 
conduct the hearing in a judicious, fair, and expeditious manner. 

(6) Disqualification of a Board Member. A member of the board shall voluntarily disqualify himself or 
herself and withdraw from any hearing in which the member cannot act in a fair and impartial 
manner, or where the member has an interest in the proceedings. Any party to a hearing may 
request disqualification of a board member by filing an affidavit stating with particularity the 

grounds for disqualification. If the board member does not disquafify himself or herself in response 

to the motion, the chair of the board shall decide the issue of disqualification. Ahearing shall be 
held if requested by the moving party or if deemed necessary by the chair. All materials pertinent 
to a matter of disqualification shall be made part of the record. 

If a board member is disqualified, thereby negating the quorum, the chair shall appoint a hearing officer 

to decide the matter in the same manner as if the board were presiding. 

(7) Judgment of the Board. The boar ill issue a decision within a reasonable time follat~rving the 
conclusion of the hearing. The decision mint be in writing and be signed by the members of the 

board. The decision shall set forth findings of fact, conclusio+~s'of fact and law, and the judgment. If 
a decision of the board is not unanimous, the decision of the majorit~j will control. The minority may 
file a dissenting opinion. 

The Board promptly shall mail or deliver a copy of its decision to the licensee, the investigating panel 
and, if appropriate, to the complainant. An order attached to the judgment will go into effect after the 
end of the 30-day appeal period if na appeal is filed. 

(8) Appeal from a Decision of the Board. A I~censee aggrieved by a judgment of the board may appeal 
that judgment to the Supreme Court. The board may grant, or the court may order, a stay of the 
board s order upon application of the l icensee. 

(9) Transcripts. A contested case bearing shall be recorded but not transcribed unless a transcript is 

requested by an interested person. Transcripts will be available for cost. The board will provide an 

estimate of transcription cost before filling an order for transcript. 

APPENDIX (D) ASBESTOS 

The Vermont Department of Health regulates the removal of asbestos containing materials, as well as 

the training of persons who remove asbestos containing materials, in the Vermont Regulations for 

Asbestos Control. For additional information, contact the Vermont Department of Health, Division of 

Environmental Health (800-439-8550). 

Page 27 



APPENDIX (E) DESIGN OF GREASE INTERCEPTOR — Reference 2021 IPC CHAPTER 1003 

EXAMPLE 

STEP I- Determine the cubic content of the fixture by multiplying length X width X depth. 

Example: A sink 48" long by 24" wide by 12" deep Cubic content 48 X 24X12 =13,824 cubic in. 

STEP 2 - Determine the capacity in gallons, 1 gal = 231 cubic inches. 

Example: Contents in gals 13,824 = 59.8 gals. 

STEP 3 - Determine actual drainage load. The fixture is,us~ally filled to about 75% of capacity with 
wastewaterthe items being washed displace about 25% of the fixture content. Actual drainage load = 
75%o of fixture capacity. 

Example: Actual Drainage Load .75 X 59.8 gals = 44.9 gals 

STEP 4 - Determine the flow rate and the drainage period. In general, good practices dictate a one-

minutedrainage period, however where conditions permit, a 2-min~rte period is acceptable. Drainage 

period is the actual time required to completely empty,the fixture. 

Flow Rate = Actual Drainage Load 

Drainage Period 

Example: Calculate flow rate for I minute period. Flow 

Rate 44.~Gal~ = 44.9 GPM 

N1in. 

For 2-minute period 

Flow Rate 44.9 Gals = 22.5 GPM 

2 Min. 

STEP 5 - Select the interceptor which corresponds to the flow rate calculated. Note --Select larger size 

when flow rate falls between tivo sizes listed. 

As a general rule, it is good practice to size the Interceptor so that its rated capacity is never less than 

40% of the fixture capacity in gallons. In the example above the actual fixture capacity is 59.8 gals., and 

40% of this would be 23.9 gals. or a Fig. 8025. It is readily seen that a drainage period other than one 
or two minutes can be used. If conditions justify, any period between one and two minutes is 

satisfactory, however, we do not recommend a period longer than 2 minutes. Using the 40% rule of 

thumb gives a drainage period of 17/8 minutes. 

Page 28 



C 

l 

VERMONT PLUMBING RULES 
The Plumbers' Examining Board 

Effective Date ......xx~cxxxxsrx - - 



- Table of Contents - 

Section 1: Purpose of the Rules... page 2 

Section 2: Scope of the Rules ... page 2 

Section 3: Definitions... page 2 

Section 4: Plumbers' Examining Board ... page 4 

Section 5: Commissioner of Public Safety. page 4 

Section 6: Duties of the Owner... page 5 

Section 7: Duties of the License Holder... page 6 

Section 8: License Examinations: 

8 (A) Master Plumbers... page 6 

8 (B) Journeyman Plumbers... page 6 

8 (C) Specialists Plumbers... page 7 

8 (D) Process for Examination... page 8 

8 (E) Examination not Required... page 8 

Section 9: Renewal of License... page 9 

Section 10: Plumbing License Fees... page 10 

Section 11: License not Required... page 10 

Section 12: Complaints... page 11 

Section: 13: Disciplinary Proceedings... page 11 

Section 14: Work Notices... page 12 

Section 15: Work Notice and Inspection Fee... page 12 

Section 16: Inspection of Plumbing Installations... page 13 

Section 17: Connecting Plumbing Installation... page 14 

Section 18: Priorities for Inspection, Review, and Investigation... page 14 

Section 19: Approval, Alternatives and Variances... page 15 

Section 20: Request for Reconsideration... page 15 

Section 21: Adoption of the 2021 International Plumbing Code (including VT amendments) ... page 15 

Section 22: Severability Clause... page 23 

Section 23: Effective Date... page 23 

Appendix (A) Vermont Plumbing Statute, 26 V.S.A. Chapter... page 24 

Appendix (B) Definition of a Public Building...page 25 

Appendix (C) Procedure for Disciplinary Proceeding... page 25 

Appendix (D) Asbestos... page 27 

Appendix (E) Design of Grease Interceptor... page 28 

Page 1 



Section 1: PURPOSE OF THE RULES 

The purpose of these rules is to protect and improve the general health and welfare of the people of 
the State of Vermont in the fields of environmental sanitation, water treatment, domestic supply and 
hydronically related hot water heating, by authorizing and enforcing rules and regulations for properly 

designed, acceptably installed and adequately maintained plumbing, water treatment and hydronically 
related water heating systems and by licensing qualified plumbers and qualified heating and water 

treatment specialists. These rules are enacted in conformance with the Vermont statutes covering 
plumbers and plumbing. 

Section 2: SCOPE OF THE RULES 

(A) These rules shall apply to all public buildings, whether connected to public water systems orpublic 
sewage systems, and to all other buildings or facilities connected to a public water or sewagesystem. 
This includes owner-occupied single-family residences. Owner-occupied single-family residences 
which are not on public water systems or public sewage systems do not require a work notice. 

Existing public buildings, and all other existing buildings or facilities which are on public water 

systems or public sewage systems must comply with these rules whenever the plumbing in those 
buildings or premises is changed, replaced, or altered. These rules shall not apply to existing private 
dwellings and public buildings except as the plumbing systems in them may be altered in the future. 

All new plumbing must comply with the current Vermont State Plumbing Code. 

(B) Section 403.4.2 shall apply to all new and existing single user toilet facility/room. 

Section 3: DEFINITIONS 

(A) The definitions set out at 26 V.S.A. Section 2172 shall be applicable for these rules: 

(1) A "public water system" or "public sewerage disposal system" shall mean any system supplying or 
serving 15 or more customers, each family, tenement, store, or other establishment being 
considered a single customer. 

(2) A "master plumber" shall mean any person, licensed under this chapter, as a business, designs 
and/or installs plumbing systems, hires or employs a person or persons to do plumbing work, or 
supervises journeyman plumbers, or apprentice plumbers in completion of their work. Licensed 
master plumbers may perform all aspects of the trade under a specialist license without being 
required to obtain a specialist license. 

(3) A "journeyman plumber" shall mean any person licensed under this chapter who installs plumbing 

and water treatment or heating specialties under the direction of a master plumber. A journeyman 

plumber may supervise an apprentice employed by a master plumber and under the master 
plumber's direction. A journeyman plumber may perform all plumbing covered by a specialist 

Page 2 



license without being required to obtain a specialist license. A journeyman plumber shall not act as 
a master plumber. 

(4) An "apprentice plumber" shall mean any person, employed by a master plumber or under the 
direction of a master plumber or a journeyman plumber, who is engaged in learning and assisting 

in the installation of plumbing and water treatment or heating specialties under an apprenticeship 
program properly registered with the Vermont Apprenticeship Council. An apprentice plumber shall 
be supervised on the job by either a master or a journeyman plumber as per Vermont Department 
of Labor apprenticeship guidelines. 

(5) "Plumbing" is the art of installing pipes, fixtures, and other apparatus for bringing in the water supply 

and removing liquid and water carried wastes and drainage venting systems within or on any 

building or structure. 

(6) "State plumbing inspector" means a master plumber or duly qualified employee of the department 
designated to enforce the rules and regulations pursuant to this chapter. 

(7) "Municipal inspector" means a plumbing inspector authorized to conduct municipal inspections 
pursuant to this chapter. 

(8) "Specialist" means any person licensed under this chapter who performs work in connection with 
water treatment and heating, or both, or performs that work as a principal business or an auxiliary 

to a principal business for the person's own account as designated on the person's license. 

(9) "Commissioner" means the commissioner of the Department of Public Safety. 

(10) "Legislative body" means the select board, the alder board, city council or board of trustees of a 
municipality or an incorporated village. 

(11) "Work notice" means the notice required to be filed and validated under Section, 14 of these rules 

by a licensee prior to commencement of plumbing work. 

(B) In addition, for the purposes of these rules: 

1) "person" shall include any person or entity who performs plumbing work or is responsible for the 

performance of plumbing work under the jurisdiction of the Plumbers' Examining Board or the 

Department of Public Safety. 

2) "board" shall mean the Plumbers' Examining Board created by 26 V.S.A. 2181; 

3) "department" shall mean the Department of Public Safety. 

4) "public building" shall be as defined in 20 V.S.A. Section 2900. (Refer to appendix B for linkto statute) 

Page 3 



5) "investigator" shall mean the person designated by the Department to work at the direction of 
theAssistant Attorney General on the investigating panel as detailed in Appendix C Section (a) (3). 

(12). MAINTENANCE. To keep existing plumbing fixtures and associated piping in good working order. 

Does not include relocation of fixtures or piping. 

Section 4: PLUMBERS' EXAMINING BOARD 

(A) The Plumbers' Examining Board is comprised of 5 members: the Commissioner of Public Safety or 
designee; the Commissioner of Health or designee; a master plumber; a journeyman plumber; a public 
member not associated with the plumbing or heating trades. 

(B) By statute the Board is responsible for: adopting plumbing rules; licensing and disciplining 

plumbers. 

1) The plumbing rules the Board adopts must be minimum performance standards reasonably 
necessary for the protection of the public against recognized health hazards (26 V.S.A. Section 2173). 
The Board may adopt a nationally recognized plumbing code and amend it to suit Vermont in fulfilling 
its rule-making duties. 

2) The Board controls the issuance, suspension and revocation of plumbers' licenses. In order to 
exercise its powers and carry out its responsibilities the board may: 

(a) Conduct or otherwise provide examinations, and review and approve applications for licensure. 

(b) Investigate all matters within its jurisdiction. 

(c) Conduct hearings with regard to the administration of its affairs, including disciplinary hearings with 

regard to licensed persons; and, 

(d) Adopt rules consistent with its statutory authority. 

(C) The public may obtain information and make submissions or requests at the Board's office. The 
Board's office is located at the Department of Public Safety, Division of Fire Safety, 1311 US Route 302, 

Barre, VT 05641-2351. 

Section 5: THE COMMISSIONER OF PUBLIC SAFETY 

The Commissioner of Public Safety or a designated representative may: 
(A) Enter any public building or premises in which an installation subject to these rules is being or has 

been installed, replaced, or altered for the purpose of performing inspections necessary to carry out 

inspection responsibilities under these rules. 

(B) In accordance with 20 V.S.A. Section 2733, order a building or premises or any part of it closed until 

any unsafe condition or violation of these rules is corrected. Where appropriate, the Commissioner 

may order the demolition, removal, or disconnection of any plumbing systems or equipment 

deemed to constitute a hazard to persons or property. 

Page 4 



(C) Cause a written notice to be delivered to the owner of any property directing them to correct any 

condition where, in the opinion of the Commissioner or a plumbing inspector, that condition 

constitutes a violation of these rules. 

(D) Order the owner to stop work on the building or premises if the work on the plumbing systems in 

them are proceeding in contravention of these rules or are considered unsafe. 

(E) Direct tests of materials, devices, or assemblies made, or sufficient evidence or proof be submitted, 

at the expense of the owner, where the evidence or proof is necessary to determine whether the 

material, device or installation method meets the requirements of these rules. 

(F) Revoke, amend, or refuse to issue a plumbing work notice where, in the opinion of the 

Commissioner or a plumbing inspector, the results of tests referred to in Subsection (e) of this 

section are not satisfactory. 

(G) Order the removal of any plumbing systems or equipment installed in violation of these rules. 

(H) Prioritize inspections of plumbing systems based on the relative risks to persons or property arising 

from potential plumbing code violations. 

(I) Pursuant to 26 V.S.A. 2175(d), assess an administrative penalty for each violation of this code. 

(J) Order any company supplying fuel service to the premises to disconnect the fuel supply until the 

cited violation has been removed or corrected. 

Section 6: DUTIES OF THE OWNER 

The owner of the building or structure, or a designated representative shall: 

(A) Not install or maintain, or cause to be installed or maintained, any plumbing system or equipment 

which is unsafe or is likely to be unsafe to persons or property. 

(B) Observe these rules in all public buildings, or private residences on public water or sewer, which 

are under their control. 

(C) Allow the Commissioner or a plumbing inspector to enter any public building, or private residence 

on public water or sewer, at any reasonable time for the purposes of administering or enforcing these 

rules. 

(D) File a work notice and obtain a validated work notice required under Section 14 of these rules 

before anv plumbing work begins in asingle-family home connected to a public water or sewage 

system. 

Page 5 



(E) En~a~e the services of a properly licensed plumber to file a work notice and obtain a validated work 

notice as required under Section 14 of these rules before any plumbing work begins in a public building. 

Section 7: DUTIES OF A LICENSE HOLDER 

(A) Any person who has obtained a plumbing license under these rules shall: 

(1) Observe these rules regarding the installation of all plumbing work and the supervision of 

unlicensed employees. 

(2) Not begin plumbing work until a work notice for the work has been validated by the 

department. 

(3) Notify the department of a change of address. 

(4) Provide all information requested by the department 

(B) Any licensed plumber who has filed a work notice shall: 

(1) Keep records which outline who has accomplished the work covered under a work notice. 

(2) Provide at least 5 working days' notice to the plumbing inspector for any required 

inspection. 

(3) Provide access for the plumbing inspector to all plumbing work and records subject to 

inspection. 

Section 8: LICENSE EXAMINATIONS 

To become licensed to do plumbing work in the State of Vermont an applicant must meet the 

requirements established in the following sections: 

(A) Master Plumbers 

Any person who completes an application for a master plumber's license, presents documentation of 

having held a valid journeyman plumber's license under this chapter for a least 12 months, or 

documents equivalent training and experience in or outside of this state acceptable to the board, and 

pays an examination fee in an amount determined by the board based on the costs associated with 

administering the examination, shall be entitled to an examination. 

Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a licensing fee, the applicant shall 

receive a master plumber's license in the form of a wallet-sized card. The license shall be carried by the 

master plumber at all times while performing the licensee's trade and shall be displayed upon request. 

Upon request of a license holder, a license certificate, suitable for framing, shall be available for a fee. 

(B) Journeyman Plumbers 

Any person who completes an application for a journeyman plumber's license and documents 

apprenticeship in plumbing which includes both instruction and practice in work processes as verified 

by the Vermont apprenticeship council, or equivalent training and experience in or out of this state 

acceptable to the board, and pays an examination fee to be determined by the board based on the 

costs associated with administering the examination, shall be entitled to examination. 

Page 6 



Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a licensing fee, the applicant shall 
receive a journeyman plumber's license in the form of a wallet-sized card. The license shall be carried 
by the journeyman at all times while performing the licensee's trade and shall be displayed upon 
request. Upon request of a license holder, a license certificate, suitable for framing, shall be available 
for a fee. 

(C) Limited licensure; Specialists 

Any person who completes an application for a specialist's license and documents apprenticeship in 
plumbing which includes both instruction and practice in work processes as verified by the Vermont 
Apprenticeship Council, or successful completion of instruction, training and experience in or out of 
the state acceptable to the board and pays an examination fee to be determined by the board based 
on the costs associated with administering the examination, shall be entitled to an examination. 

Upon successful completion of the examination and payment of a license fee, the applicant shall 
receive a specialist license in the form of a wallet-sized card. The license shall be carried by the licensee 
at all times while performing the licensee's specialty and shall be displayed upon request. Upon request 
by the license holder, a specialist license suitable for framing shall be available for a fee. A specialist 
license shall indicate each specialty for which the licensee has been approved. A specialist license does 
not take the place of any other license required by law. 

Specialty fields for limited licenses include the following: 

(1) Water Heater Specialist: Installation, replacement and repair of any residential, industrial or 
commercial domestic hot water supply tanks. 

(2) Heating Svstem Specialist: Installation, replacement and repair of residential, industrial, or 
commercial hydronic space heating systems, including radiant, solar and other types of hydronic 

system design. Any work on steam systems shall be limited to steam systems with operating pressure 
not to exceed 15 PSI. 

(3) Water Treatment Specialist: Installation, replacement, and repair of residential, industrial, or 

commercial potable water treatment and filtration equipment. 

A person duly licensed as a specialist under this section may perform specialty limited use work, either 

as an employee or as an independent contractor only in connection with the specialty field designated 

on the person's license. A specialist may perform a supply connection to an existing water supply for 

test and related system operation, but at no time shall any specialist perform any plumbing or heating 

work that is not specified or permitted under the specialist's license. 

The intent of these rules as they apply to the installation of fixtures and plumbing related to specialist 

licenses is to ensure the safety of the potable water supply. It is not the intent of these rules to regulate 

the operation, efficiency or consumer satisfaction of water heaters, hydronic heating systems, or water 

treatment equipment. The Vermont Fire and Building Safety Code and the Vermont Electrical Safety 

Rules regulate the safe operation of water heaters, hydronic heating systems, water treatment 

equipment and the related fuel or power source. 

Pale 7 



(D) Process for Examinations 

(1) Each applicant for a license shall present to the executive office of the board on blanks furnished 
by the board, a written application for examination and license containing such information as the 

board may require, accompanied by the fee required. Examinations shall be in whole or in part in 
writing and shall include the theoretical and practical nature of plumbing or specialties, or both, 

and knowledge of state laws and department of health and environmental conservation regulations 
and such other regulations as the board may determine necessary to satisfactorily determine the 
qualifications of the applicant. Examinations shall be relevant to the instructional material taught 
in classes, the codes used and new developments and procedures within the trade. 

(2) In order to carry out its responsibilities under this section the board may contract with a national 

testing organization to develop and administer a written plumbing exam. Any test fees charged by 

the testing organization are separate from the examination fee charged by the board and shall be 

paid directly to the testing organization. 

(3) Any individual who fails to achieve a passing grade on a plumbing licensing examination, after 

having taken the examination three times, shall appear before the board for the purpose of the 

board recommending further education, training and/or tutoring, prior to the applicant taking the 

test a fourth time. 

(4) See License procedure in Appendix F. License testing is facilitated by a third-party vendor. 

(E) Examination not Required 

Appropriate licenses without examination may be issued to the following applicants upon payment of 

the required fee: 

,(A1 Reciprocal licenses - To a person to whom a master plumber's license, a journeyman plumber's 

license, or a specialist plumber's license has been previously issued by another state or municipality 

therein, provided that state or municipality therein maintains a standard of requirements 

equivalent to those of this state and who presents satisfactory proof to the board that he or she is 

a bona fide master, journeyman, or specialist plumber. An applicant under this subsection shall be 

exempt from examination only if he or she holds a license from a foreign state or municipality and 

if under the laws or regulations of the foreign state or municipality issuing the license a like 

exemption is granted to plumbers duly licensed under the laws of this state. 

~ Service Members and Veteran's - Except as otherwise provided by law, a iournevman's license shall 

be issued without examination and upon payment of requested fee to an applicant who is a service 

member or veteran who: 

Page 8 



(1) submits a complete application and anv documentation required by the Board; 

(2) has received designation by the U. S. Armed Forces as a 12K Plumber or equivalent; and 

(3) has completed a minimum of 8000 hours and four years of active duty field work as a 12K 
slumber or equivalent 

f~ Universal Licensing: 

(a)(1) Appropriate licenses without examination maybe issued to a person to whom a master plumber's license 

or a journeyman plumber's license or a specialty license or equivalent has been previously issued by another 

state or municipality upon the payment of the required fee if: 

(A) that state or municipality maintained a standard of requirements equivalent to those of this State; and 

(B) the applicant presents satisfactory proof to the Board that he or she is a bona fide licensee. 

(C) the applicant completes a VT Energy Goals Education Module & includes the certificate with the application. 

The website to access the module is: VT Energy Goals • Custom Portal (powerappsportals.us) 

Section 9: RENEWAL OF LICENSE 

(A) A license shall be valid for two years. A notice of renewal and application for renewal of license shall 
be provided to each licensee prior to the expiration of the license. The application for renewalof 
license and the appropriate fee must be received by the department prior to the date the license 

expires. It is the responsibility of the licensee to contact the licensing office for a renewal application 

in advance of expiration date if no renewal form is received prior to expiration date. 

(B) If a license has lapsed it may be renewed within 90 days of its expiration date along with a $15.00 
reinstatement fee in addition to the renewal fee. 

(C) If a license is not renewed within 90 days of expiration date the inactive licensee shall make 

application for reinstatement and shall appear before the board to request reinstatement. 

(D)Applicants for license renewal shall provide to the Board evidence of completion of 8 hours of 

continuing education or training, approved by the Board, within the previous 24-month period, at 

least 2 hours of which must include code review. A course or training program is valid for only one 

license renewal. A copy of the certificate is acceptable evidence of meeting the requirements for 

continuing education. 

(E) Approval of continuing education or training; 

(1) Sponsors of training courses shall submit for approval the following information: 

a) Sponsoring organization or individuals; 

b) Course content; 

c) Number of hours of eligible training; 

Page 9 



d) Instructors should be certified as a master plumber, engineer, plumbing inspector, 
vocational teacher with related experience, or otherwise acceptable by the Board; 

e) Date and place of instruction; 

f) Instructional materials to be used by attendees. 

(2) Subject matter shall deal with the adopted current plumbing codes, license renewal protocol or 
related information. This may include general or specific review of the code, code changes from 
preceding versions, common violations of the code, or other related areas that relate to the 
specialty plumbing installation. 

(3) Tests at training programs are optional. 

(4) Upon completion of a course, certificates shall be issued to attendees and shall include: a) Sponsor's 

name 

b) Course title 

c) Date, place 

d) Hours completed 

e) Instructor's Signature 

f) Attendees' full name, license number. 

(F) Representatives of the Licensing Board and the Department of Public Safety reserve the right to 
monitor all courses. 

Section 10: PLUMBING LICENSE FEES 

Plumbing license and 2-year renewal fees* shall be as established under 26 V.S.A. Section 2193(c) 

asfollows: 

(1) Master plumber license...$120 

(2) Journeyman plumber license...$90 

(3) Specialist license - per specialty field...$50 

(4) Master renewal fee...$120 

(5) Journeyman renewal fee...$90 

(6) Specialist renewal fee - per specialty field...$50 

(7) License certificate...$10 

* Subject to fee change by Legislative Process 

Section 11: LICENSE NOT REQUIRED 

(A) All plumbing and specialty work performed in Vermont shall be performed by persons licensed 

under this chapter except that a license shall not be required for the following types of work: 

Page 10 



(1) Any plumbing and specialty work performed by an owner or the owner's regular employees in the 
owner-occupied freestanding single-family dwelling or in outbuildings accessory to the owner-

occupied,single family dwelling. 

(2) Installations of plumbing systems in laboratories for experimental purposes only. 

(3) A person who regularly employs a maintenance person whose duties include the maintenance of 
plumbing on the property of that person. 

(4) Plumbing or specialty installations performed as part of a training project of a vocational school or 
other educational institution. However, the installation shall be inspected if the building is to be 
sold as a private dwelling or public building. 

(5) A person who performs miscellaneous jobs of manual labor on the person's own property in the 
course of which plumbing repairs or alterations are made. 

(6j For the construction, repair or maintenance of buildings used exclusively for agricultural purposes 
and animal housing located on owner-occupied farms. 

(7) Work performed by employees of any public or private water company, who in the main course of 
their employment install, maintain or repair water supply pipes, meters or control valves. 

Section 12: COMPLAINTS 

A person may file a complaint with the board by doing so in writing, setting forth a full statement of 

the facts concerning the alleged infraction of the plumber's licensing statute or rules. In the event a 

complaint is filed with the Board, the Board's investigation shall not be limited to the matter set forth 

in the request for investigation but may extend to any act coming to the attention of the board which 

appears to violate the statute or these rules. 

Section 13: DISCIPLINARY PROCEEDINGS. 

(A) In accordance with 26 V.S.A. Section 2181, the board may revoke or suspend a license, or refuse to 

renew a license. This shall not preclude the board from taking lesser steps, including, but not limited 

to formal reprimand, or required further education and training. The board may act for any of the 

following reasons: 

(1) Fraud or deceit in obtaining a license. 

(2) Gross negligence, incompetency, misrepresentation, ormisconduct by a licensee. 

(3) Violation by a licensee ofthe rules ofthe Department of Health, the Department of PublicSafety 

Board 

(4) Failure to comply with a written notice issued under sections 2173, 2174 or 2175 of this title. 

Page 11 



(B) The board may take these actions only after notice and provision to the licensee of an opportunity 
to appear before the board for a hearing, in accordance with 3 V.S.A. Chapter 25, the Vermont 
Administrative Procedure Act, and these rules issued thereunder. 

(C) The board and department will proceed with initiating a complaint against a licensee, investigation 
of the complaint, action and hearings as described in Appendix C. 

Section 14: WORK NOTICES 

(A) A work notice shall be filed with the department for all plumbing work covered by these rules and 

be validated by the department, prior to the start of such work, in order to facilitate the inspection 

process authorized by 26 V.S.A. 2199. The term "Permit" as used in the ~8 2021 International 

PlumbingCode (IPC) shall have the same meaning as "Work Notice validated by the department". 

(B) The department may refuse to validate a work notice if the license holder has other ongoing 

plumbing work for which a work notice has not been filed, if the department is owed fees or 

penalties, or if requested by the Plumbers' Examining Board pursuant to 26 V.S.A. 2181(c). 

(C) A work notice is not required for plumbing work described as follows: 

(1) Delete and replace Replacement of a plumbing fixture/appliance by a similar fixture/appliance 

utilizing existing water supply, waste lines, source of fuel and venting termination if the 

fixture/appliance being replaced meets currently adopted codes and is not being moved to a new 

location 

(2) Maintenance or repair within an existing plumbing fixture; 

(3) Replacement of water supply and waste lines without relocation or installation of new plumbing 

fixtures. 

(D) The department may accept an annual plumbing work notice where plumbing installation work is 

ongoing in an existing building. A plumbing work notice filed under this section shall include the name 

and location of the building, the licensed plumber responsible for the work and the payment of the 

minimum fee. The acceptance of an annual plumbing work notice does not modify the requirements 

for licensure or supervision as established under these rules. 

(E) A validated work notice shall expire if the plumber of record ceases work authorized under the 

work notice is not commenced, or is suspended or abandoned, for a time period of 180 days. 

Section 15: SCHEDULE OF WORK NOTICE AND INSPECTION FEES 

(A) Fees established by the legislature under 26 V.S.A. Section 2175(a) shall be paid to the 

Commissioner or a designated representative prior to the validation of a work notice. 

(1) For all plumbing work, identified as a priority for inspection and review under Section 18 of these 

rules, the fee shall be: 

Page 12 



(a) $10 for each plumbing fixture/appliance/device described as a washing machines, dishwashers 
grease, oil, sand, or neutralizing interceptors, sewage ejector pumps, water closets, urinals, bidets, 
disposal, drinking fountains or bottle fillers, water cooler, lavatories, bathtubs, showers, sinks, disposals, hose 
bibbs, eye washes or emergency showers, floor drains, roof drains, floor sinks, Water meters, backflow 
prevention devices, pressure reducing valves or similar device. The total shall not be less than $50. 

(b) $15 for each plumbing fixture described as a water heaters, domestic hot water coils, Plate 
Exchangers, (boilers, or hydronic unit heater), domestic hot water coil, solar panels, geothermal heat 
pumps, water treatment, pumps, thermal expansion or pressure tanks, thermostatic mixing valves, 
Domestic Fire Sprinkler Heads or Systems, or water treatment. 

2) For all plumbing work, not identified as a priority for inspection and review under Section 18 of these 
rules, the fee shall be $50. 

(B) At the discretion of the Commissioner, whenever an owner or licensed plumber requests for the 
owner's or licensed plumber's benefit that an inspection be made outside of the normal working hours, 
all fees payable by the owner under this section shall be paid in an amount twice that indicated under 
this section. 

Section 16: INSPECTION OF PLUMBING INSTALLATIONS 

The process for inspection and review of plumbing work, identified as a priority for inspection and 
review under Section 18 of these rules, shall be as follows: 

(A) PLANS 

Plumbing plans are not required for the plumbing work covered under these rules unless, in the opinion 
of the Commissioner or a designated representative, the job is of sufficient size or complexity to 

warrant such plans. 

(B) ROUGH INSPECTIONS 

A plumbing system installed under these rules shall not be covered unless it is first inspected by a 

plumbing inspector. The provisions of this section may be specifically waived by a designated 

representative. 

(C) FINAL INSPECTIONS 

(1) Upon completion of a new plumbing installation, the applicant shall request a final inspection by a 

plumbing inspector. Within 5 working days of the receipt of the inspection request, the Commissioner, 

or designated representative, shall conduct an inspection, establish a reasonable date for inspection, 

or issue a waiver of inspection. 

Page 13 



(2) The plumbing inspector may waive the presence of the licensee who filed the work notice for rough 
and final inspections. 

Section 17: CONNECTING INSTALLATIONS 

New plumbing installations shall not commence unless a work notice has been validated by the 
department. 

Section 18: PRIORITIES FOR INSPECTION, REVIEW AND INVESTIGATION 

Priorities for inspection, review and investigation are established, consistent with 26 V.S.A. 2173 (b), 

based on the type and size of the building, the complexity of the plumbing work and consideration of 
health risks to persons or property resulting from potential plumbing code violations, as follows: 

(A) Priority inspection and review work based on use: 

(1) Plumbing work involving commercial food preparation and food process areas. 

(2) Plumbing work involving special hazards in commercial operations such as Automotive repair 
garages, car wash, laundry, dry cleaning, funeral home, laboratory, or industrial hazardous 
waste discharge. 

(3) Plumbing work done in facilities where the occupants may be most vulnerable to risk such as a 

hospital, nursing home, health center, doctor or dentist's office, beauty parlor, day care or 

elementary or secondary school. 

(4) Plumbing work involving public swimming pools, public spas and hot tubs. 

(5) Plumbing work done in buildings containing multiple dwelling units, including hotels, motels 

and inns. 

(6) Plumbing work done in buildings or having an occupant load of 300 or more persons or where 

multi-user style bathrooms are installed. 

(B) Priority for investigations in descending order of priority: 

(1) Complaints alleging serious plumbing violations. 

(2) Plumbing work being done by non-licensed persons. 

(3) Plumbing work being done where no work notice has been filed with the Department. 

(4) Complaints alleging non-serious plumbing violations. 

(C) Plumbing work not listed as a priority in subsection (A) or (B) above is required to be installed and 

completed in accordance with these rules and is subject to random inspection and enforcement 

actions by the State Plumbing Inspector. 

(D) All plumbing work in a building shall be classified as priority plumbing work where both priority and 

non-priority plumbing work occur on the same water and/or waste water systems. 

Page 14 



Section 19 APPROVAL, ALTERNATIVES, AND VARIANCES 

The approval of materials, equipment and devices and alternatives and variances to this code, shall be 
in accordance with Section 105 of the 20211nternational Plumbing Code. 

Section 20: REQUEST FOR RECONSIDERATION 

A person aggrieved by an interpretation of these rules, or the result of any inspection or an order to 
correct code violations may request that the Commissioner or designated representative reconsider 
such refusal or order. A request for reconsideration shall be made within 15 days after receipt of 
written notice of such refusal or order. The Commissioner or designated representative shall review 
the refusal or order within 30 days of the date the request for reconsideration is received. The 
Commissioner or designated shall issue an order amending, modifying or affirming the prior refusal or 

order as circumstances require within 30 days of the date of the review. A person aggrieved by the 
decision under this section may appeal to the superior court. 

Section 21: ADOPTION OF A NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED CODE: 

THE 2021 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

(A) Under 26 V.S.A. Section 2173, the board adopts the provisions of the 2021 International Plumbing 

Code (hereinafter referred to as 2021 IPC). All plumbing installations shall comply with the 2021 IPC, 

as amended in this section to meet the individual needs of Vermont. The deletion of certain articles 

and sections of the 2021 IPC has been necessary to ensure consistency with existing regulatory 

authority. The failure to incorporate these codes in their entirety should not be construed to minimize 

the value of these Codes as effective standards with current technology. 

All references to the International Building Code, International Residential Code (IRC), the 

International Fuel Gas Code or the International Mechanical Code in the 2021 IPC are deleted and 

replaced with the current Vermont Fire and BuildingSafiety Code, including NFPA 31, 54, 58 and 211 

http://firesafety.vermont.~ov 

Food and lodging Service Establishments shall conform to Vermont Health Department regulations 

(800-439- 8550) http://healthvermont.~ov. 

Public and private water systems, and underground injection control shall conform to the regulations 

of the Agency of Natural Resources (ANR) Drinking Water and Ground Water Protection Division 

(802-828-1535) http:drinkin~water.vt.~ov/. 

Stormwater management shall conform to the regulations of ANR's stormwater program. (802-828-

1535) https://dec.vermont.~ov/watershed 

Page 15 



(B) Add, amend, delete and replace as follows: 

-delete and replace - Section 101.1 Title: These rules shall be known as tie 2021 Vermont 

Plumbing Rules (hereinafter referred to as "this code"). 

-delete and replace- Section 101.2: Scope: The design and installation of plumbing systems 
including sanitary and storm drainage, sanitary facilities and water supplies, storm water 

and sewage disposal, located within the building and the connecting pipes within 10 feet 
of the building, shall comply with the requirements of this code. The design and 

installation of gas piping and the design and installationof fire sprinkler and standpipe 

systems shall be in accordance with the Vermont Fire and Building SafetyCode. 

-delete - Section 101.3 

-delete and replace- Section 102.2 Existing Installations: Existing public buildings, and all 

other existingbuildings or facilities must comply with these rules whenever the plumbing 
in those buildings or premises is changed, replaced, or altered as required by section 

102.4. 

-delete- Section 103 Code Compliance Agency 

-delete and replace- Section 104: Duties and Powers of the Code Official: The 

Commissioner of the department of Public Safety or designee shall be designated as the 

code official for the purpose of thiscode. The code official shall have the authority to 

render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and procedures to clarify the 

application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in 

compliance with the intent and purpose of this code. 

-delete- Section 106 Permits: Except for 106.5.7 Posting of Permit: The permit (work notice) or a 

copy shall be kept on the site of the work until the completion of the project. [Note: See 

sections 14 and 15 of these rules in regards to work notices] 

-delete and replace- Section 108.2 Required Inspections and Testing: The holder of the 

permit shall beresponsible for notifying the code official to schedule inspections required 

by these rules and other inspections and testing as required by sections 108.2.1 through 

and including 108.4.3 

-delete- Section 109 Fees 

-delete- Section 115 Violations 

-delete- Section 114 Means of Appeal: [Note: See section 20 in regard to reconsideration] 

-delete —APPENDIX F: BOARD OF APPEALS: [Note: See section 20 in regard to reconsideration] 

Page 16 



-amend - Section 202 General Definitions 

"BOILER" includes all steam, hydronic boilers, and water source heat pump units. 

"HYDRONIC UNIT HEATER" includes: all hydronic kick space heaters, hydronic fan assisted 

cabinet heaters, and hydronic fan/coil air handlers 

LEAD-FREE PIPE AND FITTING. See Chapter 605.2.1 Pipe and fittings used for human 

consumption(water for drinking or cooking) shall meet the most recent NSF/ANSI 

low lead standard (<0.25%weighted average lead content-wetted surface). For 

additional information contact the office of the Attorney General at (802-828- 3171) or 

AGO.I~ad~a state.vt.us. 

See also http://a~o.vermont.~ov/assets/files/LeadinPlumbin~.pdf 

MAINTENANCE. To keep existing plumbing fixtures and associated piping in good working order. 

Does not include relocation of fixtures or piping. 

PLUMBING. The art of installing pipes, fixtures and other apparatus for bringing in the 

water supply and removing liquid and water carried wastes and drainage venting systems 

within or on any buildingor structure. 

-delete- Section 301.3 exception (refer to Agency Natural Resources (ANR) regulations). 

-delete and replace- Section 302.2 Industrial Wastes: Waste products from manufacturing 

or industrialoperation introduced into the public sewer system are regulated by the 

Vermont Agency of Natural Resources. 

-delete- Section 305.4.1 Sewer depth (refer to Agency Natural Resources (ANR) regulations) 

-delete and replace- Section 311 Toilet Facilities for Workers: Toilet Facilities for Workers 

are regulatedby the Vermont Department of Labor (V0SHA). 

-delete and replace- Section 313.1 Equipment Efficiencies: Equipment efficiencies are 

regulated underthe Commercial Building Energy Standards, as adopted by the Vermont 

Department of Public Service. 

-add- Section 314.2.1.2 All condensate disposal shall conform to ANR regulations (802-828-1535). 

-amend- Table 403.1 The minimum water closet and lavatory requirement for restaurants, 

banquet halls and food courts shall be in accordance with the Health Regulations for Food 

Service Establishments adopted by the Department of Health. 

Page 17 



For access to Health Regulations for Food Establishments 

refer to; http://www.healthvermont.~ov/about-us/laws-regulations/rules-and-regulations 

-add- Section 403.1.1.1 Gender Free Restrooms and Required Fixture Counts: When a new 

gender freerestroom is provided in an occupancy that has the total number of required 
plumbing fixtures set forth in the plumbing code and is fixed separately for both men and 
women, the fixtures in the new genderfree restroom shall be deducted from the total 

required fixture count of either the men's or women'srestrooms. 

-add — Section 403.4.2 Single-user restroom signage: Single-user toilet facility/room shall 

be provided with a sign "RESTROOM". Signage for Accessible toilet facility/room shall 

comply with the Vermont Access Rules. 

-delete and replace- Section 404 Accessible plumbing facilities: Accessible plumbing 

facilities and fixtures shall be provided in accordance with the Vermont Access Rules. 

-amend- Section 412.1 Faucets and other fittings shall meet the most recent NSF/ANSI 

low lead standard (<0.25%weighted average lead content — wetted surface). 

-delete - 412.10 Head Shampoo sink faucet. 2. A water heater conforming to ASSE 1082. 

-add- Section 424.3 Waterless urinals: the installation of waterless urinals are permitted, 

subject to theprior approval of the Plumbers' Examining Board guidelines. 

-add-Section 501.1.1 TEMPERATURE CONROL FOR HOT WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEMS ONLY, 

additional downstream safety devices may be required. 

Water heaters, tank style and tankless, shall be equipped with an ASSE 1017 

Temperature actuated mixing valve in accordance with 602.2. 

-amend-Section 501.2 Water heater as space heater. Where a combination potable water 

and space heating system requires water for space heating at temperatures higher than 

120°F (49°C), a temperature actuated mixing valve complying with ASSE 1017 shall be 

provided to limit the water supplied to the potable hot water distribution system to a 

temperature of 120°F (49°C) or less. The potability of the water shall be maintained 

throughout the system. 

-delete and replace- Section 501.6 Water temperature control in piping from tankless 

heaters: The temperature of water from tankless water heaters shall be a maximum 120°F 

(49°C) after the temperature actuated mixing valve when intended for domestic uses. This 

provision shall not supersede the requirement for protective shower valves in accordance 

with Section 412.3. 

Page 18 



-add-Section 503.3 Water Heater Connections: All connections to the water heater including the 

ASSE 1017 temperature actuated mixing valve and the full port cold water shut off valve shall be 
rigidly supported using code compliant metallic piping. Metallic piping must extend a minimum of 

three feet or greater from both the hot and cold water connection points. 

-amend- Section 504.4 Relief Valve: Thermal expansion shall be controlled in accordance 

with Section 607.3 

-delete and replace- Section 504.6.13 Material for Discharge Piping: Piping shall be 

constructed ofinetallic materials listed in section 605.4 or ASME 112.4.1. 

-add- 504.6 (15) Outlet of all relief valve piping shall be cut on a 45 degree angle. 

- delete and replace- 602.2 Potable water required: Only potable water shall be supplied 

to plumbing fixtures that provide water for drinking, bathing or culinary purposes, or for 

the processing of food, medical or pharmaceutical products. Unless otherwise required by 
law, potable watershall be suppliedto all plumbing fixtures at a maximum temperature of 

120°F (49°C). 

-add- 602.3 Individual water supply systems are also regulated by Vermont Agency of 

NaturalResources. [Refer to page 15 for ANR info.] 

-add in part- Section 602.3.4 Disinfection of system; After construction or major repair, the 

individual watersupply system shall be purged of deleterious matter and disinfected in 

accordance with Section 610. 

-amend- Section 603.2 Separation of water service and building sewer: Water service pipe 

and thebuilding sewer shall be separated by 10 feet (3048 mm) of undisturbed or compacted 

earth. 

-amend- Section 603.2 delete "not less than 12 inches (305 mm)" and replace with "not less 

than 18 inches (458 mm)". 

-amend- Section 603.2 delete "at least 5 feet (1524 mm)"and replace with "at least 10 

feet (3048 mm)from the sewer pipe centerline." 

-amend- Table 604.3 

Shower 2.0 at 8 psi 

Shower, balanced pressure, thermostatic, or 2.0 at 20 psi 

Combination balanced-pressure/thermostatic 

Mixing valve 

Page 19 



-add- Section 604.4 Exception 6. In new construction, low flow water closets with a flow 

rate of 1.28 gallons per flush as outlined in the Vermont Residential Energy Code may be 
used in lieu of the maximum flow rate of 1.6 gallons per flush as outlined in Table 604.4 
of the International Plumbing Code. 

-amend- Table 604.4 

Lavatory, private 1.5 gpm at 60 psi 

Shower head 2.0 gpm at 80 psi 
Sink Faucet 1.8 gpm at 60 psi 

-amend- Section 604.7 Inadequate water pressure: Water pressure booster systems are 

also regulatedunder the Vermont Water Supply Rules; chapter 21, as adopted by the 

Vermont agency of natural resources. [Refer to page 15 for ANR info.] 

-amend- Table 605.3 Delete copper orcopper-alloy tubing of types M and WM as approved 
material. 

-amend- Table 605.4 Copper and copper-alloy tubing of types M and WM are 

restricted to above-grade use only. 

-amend- Section 606.5 Water pressure booster systems: Water pressure booster 

systems are also regulated underthe Vermont Public Water Supply Rules, as adopted by 

the Vermont Agency of NaturalResources. [Refer to page 15 for ANR info.] 

-add — Section 607.5 Pipe Insulation; Install in accordance with VT Energy Standards. For 

additional information contact the Vermont Energy Code Hotline at 855-877-0673 or 
https://publicservice.vermont.gov/content/building-energy-standards 

-amend- Section 608.1 Plumbing under the scope of these rules shall also conform to the 

Vermont Water Supply Rules, as adopted by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources, 

in regard to the prevention of cross-connections. [Refer to page 15 for ANR info.] 

-add — 608.1.1 Installation of Backflow Assemblies shall be in accordance with ASSE Backflow 

Prevention Reference Manual or AWWA Backflow Prevention and Cross-connection Control: 

Recommended Practices M14. 

-add- Section 608.9.1— equivalent wording and signage acceptable to code official 

-delete and replace- Section 608.18 Protection of individual water supplies: Individual 

water supplies are regulated by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources. 

Page 20 



-add- Section 610.1; or repaired 

-delete and replace- Section 610.1 (4) Repetition of Disinfection: The procedure shall be 
repeated whereshown by a bacteriological examination that contamination remains 
present in the system. Consecutive bacteriological samples must be taken 24 hours apart 
before the water system is put back into service. 

-amend —Section 612.1 Solar Systems: in accordance with the Vermont Plumbing Rules 

-amend - Section 613.1 Temperature-actuated mixing valves. Temperature-actuated mixing 
valves, are required to be installed to reduce water temperatures to defined limits. These valves 
shall comply with ASSE 1017 and are required to be installed at the hot water source. 

-delete and replace- Section 701.2 Sewer required: Every building in which plumbing 
fixtures are installed shall be connected to a public or private sewerage system. Public 
and private sewerage systems are regulated by the Vermont Agency of Natural Resources. 

-delete and replace- Section 701.4 Sewage Treatment: Sewage treatment. is regulated by 
the VermontAgency of Natural Resources. 

-add- Section 701.8 Drainage piping in food service areas: Waste piping above any 

working, storage or eating surfaces in food service establishments shall be suitably 

protected to prevent contamination from leakage. 

-delete- Section 702.2 Table — Polyethylene (PE) Plastic Pipe 

-delete- Section 702.4 Table — Polyethylene (PE) Plastic Pipe 

-delete- Section 702.7 Lead bends and traps. 

-amend- Section 703.1 Building sewer pipe. Delete "installed within 5 feet (1524 mm) of 

the water service" & replace with "installed within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the water 

service." 

-add - Section 704.5 Dead Ends: Drainage piping shall not be installed or altered that 

creates a dead end section of piping. Cleanout extensions and piping for future fixtures 

shall not be considered as a deadend. 

-delete-Exception in Section 705.10.2 

-delete and replace — Section 705.16.4 Plastic pipe or tubing to other piping material: 
Joints between different types of plastic pipe and/or other piping material shall be made 

with an approved adapter fitting. Joints between plastic pipe and cast-iron hub pipe shall 
be made by caulked joint or a rr~~compression joint. 

Page 21 



-delete- 708.1.5 Cleanout Size - Exception (2) 

-add- 803.3 Special Wastes System Design: Add "and shall conform to ANR regulations". 

-delete and replace — Section 903.1.1: Roof Extension "All open vent pipes that extend through 
a roof shall be terminated at least 6" but not more than 12" above the roof." 

-add- 903.1.1.1 Vent penetration through roof shall be protected against shear force. 

-delete in part- 903.2 — not less than 1 foot (305mm) 

-delete and replace- Section 904.3 Vent Termination: Vent stacks or stack vents shall 
terminate outsidethe building to the open air. 

-add- Section 906.1(.1) Size of stack vents and vent stacks: Every building shall have at 
least one 3-inch continuous stack vent or 3-inch continuous vent stack that extends to 
outside the building. 

-add- Section 906.6 Horizontal branch vents: Horizontal branch vents within unheated 
areas shall be protected against freezing. 

-add- Section 917.1.1 Single Stack Vent System: Single stack vent systems may not be used in 
single familyhomes. Single stack vent systems in all other occupancies may only to be used 
for engineered systems when approved by the plumbing inspector. 

-delete and replace- Section 918.1 General. Air Admittance Valves: Vent systems utilizing 
air admittance valves for individual and branch-type air admittance valves shall conform 
to ASSE 1051. Stack-type air admittance valves are not permitted. 

-amend- Section 918.3 Delete last sentence: Stack vents and vent stacks shall be 
permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance valves in accordance with Section 
918.3.2. 

-delete- Section 918.3.2 Stacks. 

-delete and replace- Section 918.7 Vent required: Within each plumbing system, a 
minimum of one continuous 3 inch stack vent or one continuous 3 inch vent stack shall 
extend outdoors to the open air. 

-delete and replace - Section 1002.6 —Building Traps. Building house traps shall be prohibited, 
except where local conditions necessitate such traps. Building traps shall be provided with aclean-out 
and a relief vent of fresh air intake on the inlet side of the trap. The size of the relief vent or fresh air 

Page 22 



intake shall not be less than one-half the diameter of the drain to which the relief vent or air intake 
connects. Such relief vent of fresh air intake shall be carried above grade and shall be terminated in a 
screened outlet located outside the building. 

- add- Section 1003.1 Interceptors and Separators: External interceptors and separators located 
morethan 10 feet from the building are regulated by the Agency of Natural Resources. 

-delete -Section 1003.3.7 Gravity Grease Interceptors and gravity grease interceptors with fat oils and 
grease disposal systems. Refer to ANR Rules. 

-delete and replace- Section 1101.2 Disposal. Storm drainage for a building roof or courtyard shall be 
regulated by this section. Storm drainage from paved areas, yards and courts are regulated by Agency 

of Natural Resources Watershed Management Division, stormwater program (802-828-1535). 

-add in part- Section 1109.1 General: Where the public sewer is a combined system for both 
sanitaryand storm water, thestorm sewershall be connected independentlytothe publicsewer 
in accordanceto Agency of Natural Resources Rules. 

-delete and replace - Chapter 12 Special Piping and Storage Systems: 
Section 1202.1 Nonflammable medical gasses - refer to NFPA 99 AND ASSE 6000 
(Health Care Facilities) 
Section 1203.1 Design and Installation: Nonmedical oxygen systems refer to NFPA 51 & NFPA 55 

-add- Section 1301.1.1 Non-potable Water Systems: Contact Agency of Natural Resources Drinking 
Water andGroundwater Protection Division for prior approval. 

-Delete — Chapter 14: Subsurface Graywater Soil Absorption Systems: 

Section 22: SEVERABILITY CLAUSE 

In the event any part or provision of these rules is held to be illegal, this shall not have 
the effect ofmaking void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions of these rules. 

Section 23: EFFECTIVE DATE These rules shall take effect [put in date here] 

Page 23 



APPENDIX (A) THE VERMONT PLUMBING LAW 26 V.S.A. CHAPTER 39 

For full text please refer to: https://legislature.vermont.gov/statutes/chapter/26/039 

§ 2171. Purpose 

§ 2172. Definitions 

§ 2173. Rules adopted by the board 

§ 2174. Municipal rules and regulations; municipal inspections 

§ 2175. Work notice; fees; enforcement; appeals; penalties 

§ 2176. Existing buildings 

§ 2181. Plumber's examining board; membership; powers 

§ 2182. Terms of office 

§ 2183. Fees; books and records 

§ 2184. Per diem pay and expenses 

§ 2191. Master plumbers 

§ 2192. Journeyman plumbers 

§ 2192a. Limited licensure; specialists 

§ 2193. Applications and examinations; fees 

§ 2194. Examinations not required; temporary licenses 

§ 2195. Expiration and renewal; renewal; reinstatement; continuing education 

§ 2197. Penalty 

§ 2198. Exceptions; license not required 

§ 2199. Inspections 

Page 24 



APPENDIX (B) DEFINITION OF PUBLIC BUILDING - 20 V.S.A 2900(8) 

-add- For full text refer to; https://le~islature.vermont.~ov/statutes/section/20/174/02900 

APPENDIX (C) PROCEDURE FOR LICENSING DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURE 

(A) INITIATING A COMPLAINTAGAINSTALICENSEE 

(I) Form of complaint: Filing. A person may register a complaint against a plumber licensed by the 
Plumbers' Examining Board by filing a written complaint with the Department of Public Safety, Division 
of Fire Safety, 45 State Drive Waterbury, VT 05671. The written complaint must set forth, at a 
rrinimum, the nature, date, and place of the alleged violations. The board may also initiate a license 

review procedure on its own motion by filing a complaint with the department. 

(2) Verification. Upon receipt of a complaint, the department will verify the Vermont license number 
of the person against whom the complaint is lodged. If the person is unlicensed and the complaint 
alleges criminal conduct, the department will refer the complaint to the Office of the Attorney General. 
If the person is a licensee of the board, the department will docket the complaint and open an 
investigation file under the name and license number of the person. 

(3) Investigating Panel. An investigating panel consisting of an investigator designed by the 

department and an assistant attorney general will be formed upon the docketing of a complaint. The 

assistant attorney general assigned to the case will head the panel and supervise the investigation of 

the complaint. 

(B) INITIATING THE INVESTIGATION. 

(1) Notice to the Attorney General and to the Investigator. Upon docketing the complaint, the 

department will send a copy of all materials contained in the newly opened file, including a copy of the 

complaint, to the attorney general, and notify the attorney general of the name, address and phone 

number of its designated investigator. The department will also send copies of the materials to the 

investigator and inform the investigator of the name of the division chief in the attorney general's 

office responsible for the investigation. 

(2) Notice to the Licensee. The department will send written notice of the initiation of an investigation 

to the licensee against whom the complaint has been filed. The notice shall. include a copy of the 

complaint and a copy of the statute and these rules. The notice will inform the licensee that inquiries 

or materials regarding the investigation should be addressed to the investigating panel at the address 

of the department. 

(3) Notice to the Board. The department will send written notice to the Board indicating that an 

investigation has been instituted regarding a licensing complaint. 

Page 25 



(4) The inspector assigned to investigate the complaint shall inspect the work which is the subject of 
the complaint and interview the complainant. The inspector may also meet and interview the licensee 
at the direction of the assistant attorney general assigned to the matter. 

(C) RECOMMENDED ACTION. 

(1) At the conclusion of the investigation the assistant attorney general assigned to the matter shall 

make a recommendation as to whether formal proceedings should commence against the licensee. 

(2) If formal disciplinary proceedings are recommended, the assistant attorney general shall submit a 

complaint describing the alleged violations, and the rules or statutes violated, with the 
recommendation. 

(3) If the licensee is willing to admit to the charges the assistant attorney general may explore the 

possibility of a stipulated settlement. A stipulated settlement must be approved by the board. 

(4) If no disciplinary action is recommended the case will be closed and the complainant and the 

license will be notified that no further action will be taken at this time. The matter maybe reopened if 

new evidence is presented. 

(D) FORMAL HEARING BY THE BOARD. 

(1) Notice and Place of Hearing. Upon the filing of a notice of charges by the investigating panel, the 

board will commence the hearing process by serving the notice of charges and a notice of the 

hearing upon the licensee. Notice will be served personally or by certified mail, return receipt 

requested. Copies will be sent to the members of the investigating panel and the complainant. The 

hearing will be scheduled at least 20 days after service. 

(2) Failure to Appear. If the licensee fails to appear after proper notice has been given, the board shall 

hold the hearing and make a decision on the charges. 

(3) A quorum of the board shall be a majority of its members. 

(4j Conduct of Hearing; Receipt of Evidence; Argument. The board may admit any evidence it deems 

of a type commonly relied upon by reasonably prudent persons in the conduct of their affairs. All 

persons shall testify under oath or affirmation. The licensee or his attorney may examine, or cross 

examine witnesses, inspect documents, and explain or rebut any evidence presented to the board. 

The assistant attorney general, investigator, and licensee may present oral and written argument in 

addition to evidence, which also shall be made part of the record. 

Where a licensee is not represented by counsel the board shall advise the licensee and aid in the 

examining and cross examining of witnesses as effectively as possible compatible with the impartial 

discharge of its duties as a body of impartial review. 

Page 26 



(5) Authority of the Chair. The chair shall administer oaths to witnesses, rule on questions of evidence 
and upon the service of subpoenas and other notices and do whatever is necessary and proper to 
conduct the hearing in a judicious, fair, and expeditious manner. 

(6) Disqualification of a Board Member. A member of the board shall voluntarily disqualify himself or 
herself and withdraw from any hearing in which the member cannot act in a fair and impartial 
manner, or where the member has an interest in the proceedings. Any party to a hearing may 
request disqualification of a board member by filing an affidavit stating with particularity the 

grounds for disqualification. If the board member does not disqualify himself or herself in response 
to the motion, the chair of the board shall decide the issue of disqualification. A hearing shall be 
held if requested by the moving party or if deemed necessary by the chair. All materials pertinent 
to a matter of disqualification shall be made part of the record. 

If a board member is disqualified, thereby negating the quorum, the chair shall appoint a hearing officer 

to decide the matter in the same manner as if the board were presiding. 

(7) Judgment of the Board. The board will issue a decision within a reasonable time following the 
conclusion of the hearing. The decision must be in writing and be signed by the members of the 
board. The decision shall set forth findings of fact, conclusions of fact and law, and the judgment. If 
a decision of the board is not unanimous, the decision of the majority will control. The minority may 
file a dissenting opinion. 

The Board promptly shall mail or deliver a copy of its decision to the licensee, the investigating panel 
and, if appropriate, to the complainant. An order attached to the judgment will go into effect after the 
end of the 30-day appeal period if no appeal is filed. 

(8) Appeal from a Decision of the Board. A licensee aggrieved by a judgrrrent of the board may appeal 

that judgment to the Supreme Court. The board may grant, or the court may order, a stay of the 

board's order upon application of the licensee. 

(9) Transcripts. A contested case hearing shall be recorded but not transcribed unless a transcript is 

requested by an interested person. Transcripts will be available for cost. The board will provide an 

estimate of transcription cost before filling an order for transcript. 

APPENDIX (D) ASBESTOS 

The Vermont Department of Health regulates the removal of asbestos containing materials, as well as 

the training of persons who remove asbestos containing materials, in the Vermont Regulations for 

Asbestos Control. For additional information, contact the Vermont Department of Health, Division of 

Environmental Health (800-439-8550). 

Page 27 



APPENDIX (E) DESIGN OF GREASE INTERCEPTOR — Reference 2021 IPC CHAPTER 1003 

EXAMPLE 

STEP I- Determine the cubic content of the fixture by multiplying length X width X depth. 

Example: A sink 48" long by 24" wide by 12" deep Cubic content 48 X 24X12 = 13,824 cubic in. 

STEP 2 - Determine the capacity in gallons, 1 gal = 231 cubic inches. 

Example: Contents in gals 13,824 = 59.8 gals. 

STEP 3 - Determine actual drainage load. The fixture is usually filled to about 75% of capacity with 
wastewaterthe items being washed displace about 25% of the fixture content. Actual drainage load = 
75% of fixture capacity. 

Example: Actual Drainage Load .75 X 59.8 gals = 44.9 gals. 

STEP 4 - Determine the flow rate and the drainage period. In general, good practices dictate a one-

minutedrainage period, however where conditions permit, a 2-minute period is acceptable. Drainage 
period is the actual time required to completely empty the fixture. 

Flow Rate = Actual Drainage Load 

Drainage Period 

Example: Calculate flow rate for I minute period. Flow 

Rate 44.9 Gals = 44.9 GPM 

Min. 

For 2-minute period 

Flow Rate 44.9 Gals = 22.5 GPM 

2 Min. 

STEP 5 - Select the interceptor which corresponds to the flow rate calculated. Note --Select larger size 

when flow rate falls between two sizes listed. 

As a general rule, it is good practice to size the Interceptor so that its rated capacity is never less than 

40% of the fixture capacity in gallons. In the example above the actual fixture capacity is 59.8 gals., and 

40% of this would be 23.9 gals. or a Fig. 8025. It is readily seen that a drainage period other than one 

or two minutes can be used. If conditions justify, any period between one and two minutes is 

satisfactory, however, we do not recommend a period longer than 2 minutes. Using the 40% rule of 

thumb gives a drainage period of 17/8 minutes. 

Page 28 



Vermont Laws 

VERMONT GENERAL ASSEMBLY 

https://legislature.vermont.gov/statutes/section/26/03 9/02173 

The Vermont Statutes Online 

Title 26 : Professions And Occupations 

Chapter 039 : Plumbers And Plumbing 

Subchapter 001 : General Provisions 

(Cite as: 26 V.S.A. § 2173) 

§ 2173. Rules adopted by the Board 

(a) The Plumber's Examining Board may, pursuant to the Administrative Procedure 

Act, make and revise such plumbing rules as necessary for protection of the public 

health, except that no rule of the Board may require the installation or maintenance of a 

water heater at a minimum temperature. To the extent that a rule of the Board conflicts 

with this subsection or with 18 V.S.A. chapter 40, that rule shall be invalid and 

unenforceable. The rules shall be in effect in every city, village, and town having a public 

water system or public sewerage system and apply to all premises connected to the 

systems and all public buildings containing plumbing or water treatment and heating 

specialties whether they are connected to a public water or sewerage system. The local 

board of health and the Commissioner of Public Safety shall each have authority to 

enforce these rules. The rules shall be limited to minimum performance standards 

reasonably necessary for the protection of the public against accepted health hazards 

and shall be consistent with any minimum efficiency standards for plumbing fixtures 

adopted under 9 V.S.A. chapter 74. The Board may, if it finds it practicable to do so, 

adopt the provisions of a nationally recognized plumbing code and as needed shall 

adopt aVermont-specific amendment to the adopted code to ensure that it is consistent 

with any minimum efficiency standards for plumbing fixtures adopted under 9 V.S.A. 

chapter 74. 

(b) The Commissioner shall make rules and adopt procedures and priorities for 

inspections and enforcement. Installations regulated by the Board shall be inspected by 

a State plumbing inspector. The Commissioner may set priorities based on consideration 

of health risks to persons and property, type and size of the building, and the complexity 

and size of the installation or job. 

(c) The Commissioner or any State plumbing inspector designated by the 

Commissioner shall have the authority to enter any premises in which an installation 

subject to the rules of the Board is being or has been installed, replaced, or repaired for 

the purpose of performing inspections necessary to carry out inspection responsibilities 

under this subchapter. If the owner or occupant of the premises refuses entry, the 

Commissioner may apply to any Superior Court to issue an order enforcing the right of 

1 of 2 9/23/2022, 10:18 AM 



Vermont Laws hrips ://legislature.vermont.gov/statutes/section/26/03 9/02173 

entry. (Added 1959, No. 215, § 3, eff. June 2, 1959; amended 1979, No. 122 (Adj. Sess.), § 

1; 1987, No. 268 (Adj. Sess.), § 6, eff. June 21, 1988; 1993, No. 176 (Adj. Sess.), § 3; 2005, 

No. 8, § 11, eff. April 25, 2005; 2007, No. 92 (Adj. Sess.), § 10a; 2017, No. 127 (Adj. Sess.), 

§ 2; 2017, No. 139 (Adj. Sess.), § 7.) 

2 of 2 9/23/2022, 10:18 AM 



Vermont Secretary of State Rules Service https://secure. vermont. gov/SOS/rules/results.php 

Proposed Rules Postings 
A Service of the Office of the Secretary of State 

• Ve~~n~nt.~cn- 
• :I~eedba~,k
• St.-)S Wel~site 
• APA Site 

Code of Ve~~n~nt Rules 

• Recent
C~;~r•rh Rr~t~c 

• t `alryi~ri:ar 

•  ~l].~}5CYi~}e

•  L~..Pr~. C.011t~Ct .~.11t0 

Search Rules 

Deadline For Public Comment 

Deadline: Sep 02, 2022 

The deadline for public comment has expired. Contact the agency or primary 
contact person listed below for assistance. 

Rule Details 

Rule Number: 22P019 

Title: 2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules 

Type: Standard 

Status: Proposed 

Agency: Plumbers' Examination Board 

Legal Authority: 26 V.S.A. § 2173 

The primary intent and focus of this rule is to update 
the Vermont adoption of the International Plumbing 
Code from the 2018 edition to the 2021 edition. The 

Summary: rules also allow for the updating of current methods 
and materials to be utilized. These rules are amended 
to clarify intent and answer frequently asked 

1 of 4 9/23/2022, 10:19 AM 



Vermont Secretary of State Rules Service hops://secure. vermont.gov/SOS/rules/results.php 

Persons Affected: 

questions. 

Licensed plumbers, consulting engineers, the City of 
Burlington and other local Cities and towns, the 
Department of Health, the Agency of Natural 
Resources, the Department of Buildings and General 
Services, Vermont Fuel Dealers Association, 
Vermont Home Builders and Remodelers 
Association,Office of the Attorney General, 
Plumbers & PipefittersLoca1693, International Code 
Council (ICC), Building Safety Association of 
Vermont, Agency of Commerce and Community 
Development, Department of Labor (State 
Apprenticeship Council), Vermont Technical College 
(Technology Extension Division) American Institute 
of Architects, American Society of Heating, 
Refrigeration & Air Conditioning Engineers, 
American Council of Engineering Consultants, 
Division of Historic Preservation, Vermont Bar 
Association, Vermont Bankers Association, 
Association of Vermont Credit Unions, Vermont 
Association of Realtors, home owners and 
commercial building owners. 

There will be no adverse effect from the current 

Economic Impact: 
rules. Updating the Plumbing Code may provide 
some cost saving alternatives, not currently available 
in the currently adopted Code version. 

Posting date: Jul 27,2022 

Hearing Information 

Information for Hearing # 1 

Hearing date: 08-26-2022 10:00 AM _ ._ 

Location: Vermont Public Safety Headquarters 

Address: 45 State Drive 

City: Waterbury 

State: VT 

Zip: 05671 

Hearing Notes: 

Contact Information 

Information for Primary Contact 

PRIMARY CONTACT PERSON - A PERSON WHO IS ABLE TO ANSWER 
QUESTIONS ABOUT THE CONTENT OF THE RULE. 

2 of 4 9/23/2022, 10:19 AM 



Vermont Secretary of State Rules Service https://secure.vermont. gov/SOS/rules/results.php 

Level: 

Name: 

Agency: 

Address: 

City: 

State: 

Zip: 

Telephone: 

Fax: 

Email: 

Website Address 

Primary 

Gerald Garrow 

Plumbers' Examination Board 

Department of Public Safety, 56 

Howe Street Bldg. A, Suite 200 

Rutland 

VT 

05701-3449 

802-786-5841 

802-786-5872 

gerald. garrow@vermont. gov 

www.firesafety.vermont. gov 

Information for Secondary Contact 

SECONDARY CONTACT PERSON - A SPECIFIC PERSON FROM WHOM 

COPIES OF FILINGS MAY BE REQUESTED OR WHO MAY ANSWER 

QUESTIONS ABOUT FORMS SUBMITTED FOR FILING IF DIFFERENT 

FROM THE PRIMARY CONTACT PERSON. 

Level: Secondary 

Name: 
Robert Sponable, Deputy 

Director 

Agency: 
Division of Fire Safety -

Department of Public Safety 

Address: 45 State Drive 

City: Waterbury 

State: VT 

Zip: 05671 

Telephone: 802-479-7566 

Fax: 802-479-7562 

Email: robert.sponable@vermont.gov 

Keyword Information 

Keywords: 

Plumbing 

License 

Inspection 

3 of 4 9/23/2022, 10:19 AM 



Vermont Secretary of State Rules Service https://secure.vermont.gov/SOS/rules/results.php 

Heating System 

Water Treatment 

,~ccessbilittr Pc~l.ic~T ~ I'rivac.y :[?olicv 

A Vermont Government Website Copyright 2022 State of Vermont 
~yvy .~k~! r~~~'4₹ .~. yy

~ ,~J I£IZI6 ~:.~ ld l~ 

4 of 4 9/23/2022, 10:19 AM 



OFFICE OF THE SECRETARY OF STATE 

VERMONT STATE ARCHIVES & RECORDS ADMINISTRATION (VSARA) 

(802) 828-2863 
Seven Days 

TO: Katie Hodges (khodges@sevendaysvt.com) Tel: (802) 865-1020 x110. 
Legals 

The Caledonian Record Tel: 748-8121 FAX: 748-1613 
Julie Poutre (adv(c~caledonian-record.com) 

Times Argus / Rutland Herald Tel: 802-747-6121 ext 2238 
Melody Hudson (classified.adsCu~rutlandherald.com) FAX: 802-776-5600 
Elizabeth Marrier elizabeth.marrierCa~rutlandherald.com ) 

The Valley News Tel: 603-298-8711 

(advertising@vnews.com) FAX: 603-298-0212 

The Addison Independent Tel: 388-4944 FAX: 388-3100 
(legals@addisonindependent.com) Attn: Display Advertising 

The Bennington Banner / Brattleboro Reformer Tel: 254-2311 ext. 132 FAX: 447-2028 

Lylah Wright (Iwri~ht@reformer.com~ Attn: Lylah Wright 

The Chronicle Tel: 525-3531 FAX: 525-3200 
(adsCa?bartonchronicle.com) 

Herald of Randolph Tel: 728-3232 FAX: 728-9275 
(ads@ourherald.com) Attn: Brandi Corvette 

Newport Daily Express Tel: 334-6568 FAX: 334-6891 

(ilafoeC«~newportvermontdailyexpress.com) Attn: Jon Lafoe 

News & Citizen (mike@stowereporter.com) 

Irene Nuzzo (irene@newsandcitizen.com and ads@stowereporter Tel: 888-2212 FAX: 888-2173 

.com removed from distribution list per Lisa Stearns. Attn: Bryan 

St. Albans Messenger Tel: 524-9771 ext. 117 FAX: 527-

Ben Letourneau (ben.letourneau@samessen~er.com) 1948 - 
Attn: Ben Letourneau 

The Islander 
Te1:802-372-5600 FAX:802-372-3025 

(islanderCa~vermontislander.com) 

Vermont Lawyer 
Attn: Will Hunter- 

(hunter.press.vermont@~mail.com) 

FROM: APA Coordinator, VSARA Date of Fax: July 25, 2022 

RE: The "Proposed State Rules " ad copy to run on August 4, 2022 

PAGES INCLUDING THIS COVER MEMO: 2 

*NOTE* 8-pt font in body. l2-pt font max. for headings - single space body. Please 

include dashed lines where they appear in ad copy. Otherwise minimize the use of white 

space. Exceptions require written approval 

If you have questions, or if the printing schedule of your paper is disrupted by holiday etc. 

please contact VSARA at 802-828-3700, or E-Mail sos.statutoryfilin~s@vermont.~ov, Thanks. 



PROPOSED STATE RULES 

Bylaw, public notice of proposed rules must be given by publication in newspapers of record. The purpose of 

these notices is to give the public a chance to respond to the proposals. The public notices for administrative 

rules are now also available online at https:I/secure.vermont.~ov/SOS/rules/ . The law requires an agency to 

hold a public hearing on a proposed rule, if requested to do so in writing by 25 persons or an association 

having at least 25 members. 

To make special arrangements for individuals with disabilities or special needs please call or write the contact 

person listed below as soon as possible. 

To obtain further information concerning any scheduled hearing(s), obtain copies of proposed rules) or 

submit comments regarding proposed rule(s), please call or write the contact person listed below. You may 

also submit comments in writing to the Legislative Committee on Administrative Rules, State House, 

Montpelier, Vermont 05602 (802-828-2231). 

2021 Vermont Plumbing Rules. 

Vermont Proposed Rule: 22P019 

AGENCY: Plumbers Examination Board 

CONCISE SUMMARY: The primary intent and focus of this rule is to update the Vermont adoption of the 

International Plumbing Code from the 2018 edition to the 2021 edition. The rules also allow for the updating 

of current methods and materials to be utilized. These rules are amended to clarify.intent and answer 

frequently asked questions. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT: Gerald Garrow, Chair, Vermont Plumbers Examining Board, 

Department of Public Safety, 56 Howe Street, Bldg. A, Suite 200,Rutland, VT 05701-3449 Tel: (802)786-5841 

Fax: (802)786-5872 Email: gerald.garrow@vermont.gov URL: www.firesafetv.verrrrant.~av 

http://www.firesafety.vermont.~ov. 

FOR COPIES: Robert T. Sponable, Deputy Director, Department of Public Safety - Division of Fire Safety, 45 

State Drive, Waterbury, VT 05671 Tel: (802)479-7566 Fax: (802)479-7562 Email: 

robert.sponableC~?vermont.~ov 




